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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ranjandas S
Sent: Friday, March 1, 2024 2:22 PM
To: Sarvesh Patil; Nimisha Jadhav
Cc: Stephen P; Shama Nair
Subject: RE: BOQ for Planters for KFC UB at BLR T2
Attachments: KFC plants.pdf

Dear Nimisha, 
 
Please find attached herewith KFC plants certified invoice to process further. 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
 

From: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>  
Sent: 01 March 2024 14:00 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Subject: Fwd: BOQ for Planters for KFC UB at BLR T2 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Nimisha, 
 
Please find enclosed invoice for KFC plants  
 
Please process the same 
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Get Outlook for iOS 

From: shreyansh gupta <spylark2020@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, February 29, 2024 11:24:08 AM 
To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: BOQ for Planters for KFC UB at BLR T2  
  
Hi Team,  
 
I have attached the bill copy for your reference. 
 
Please close the remaining amount. 
 
 
Thanks, 
Spylark 
 
On Thu, Feb 29, 2024, 11:11 AM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi, 

  

Please find enclosed purchase order for reference, 

  

Kindly submit the tax invoice 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 
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Sarvesh Patil 

  

From: shreyansh gupta <spylark2020@gmail.com>  
Sent: 31 January 2024 10:59 
To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: BOQ for Planters for KFC UB at BLR T2 

  

Hi Team, 

  

How are we proceeding further? 

  

Thanks, 

Spylark  

  

On Tue, Jan 30, 2024, 5:08 PM shreyansh gupta <spylark2020@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Team, 

  

  

Below is the quotation . 
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Thanks, 

Shreyansh 

  

On Mon, Jan 29, 2024, 6:41 PM Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi, 

  

We have requirement for Planters. 

  

Request you to please quote for the same. 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Sarvesh Patil 

  


