Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: Thursday, February 1, 2024 3:32 PM

To: Sabir ali Shah; Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Jogeswar Sahu; Binu Balachandran; Parag Pandey

Subject: FW: Delhi T1 Third Wave Coffee (Civil Interior And Plumbing Work)

Attachments: 18. Tax Invoice ( Twc Delhi T1) Shah Enterprises Mumbai.pdf; RA Bill Twc Delhi.pdf

Approved 70% Running payment as per the attached documents.

Regards
Ajit Singh

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 1, 2024 12:10 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Delhi T1 Third Wave Coffee (Civil Interior And Plumbing Work)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Team,
I Attached The Tax Invoice & RA Billl so kindly check and approved

Thanks & Regards
SHAH ENTERPRISES



