Trupti Dalvi

From: Nimisha Jadhav

Sent: 21 August 2024 17:33

To: Trupti Dalvi

Subject: Fwd: Resonance invoices

Attachments: GST-INV-24-25 -230.pdf; GST-INV-24-25 -088.pdf
Get Outlook for Android

From: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2024 12:10:27 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fwd: Resonance invoices

Hi Nimisha,
Please find the attached invoices..

Regards,
Karthick

From: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2024 11:38:46 AM

To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Resonance invoices

Dear Sir
Please find the attachment of Invoices.
Regards,

Sowri Raja
Travel Food Services chennai Pvt. Ltd.






