[{ Outlook

FW: Bill Copies Required : A. M. HASANALI & SONS

From Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Thu 11/14/2024 7:28 PM
To T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc  Yuvrajsingh Shekhawat <yuvrajsingh.shekhawat@travelfoodservices.com>

[“J 1 attachment (1 MB)
A M HASANALI AND SONS 23-24_CCI-15777.pdf;

Hi,
Please submit attached bill on SAFAL.. (Store Stamp copy attached)

From: T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 14 November 2024 18:20

To: Mahesh Gurav <mahesh.gurav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Yuvrajsingh Shekhawat
<yuvrajsingh.shekhawat@travelfoodservices.com>; Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudhir Arora
<sudhir.arora@travelfoodservices.com>; T2 BLR RA <t2blr.ra@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS
<invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Bangalore Stores <bangalore.store@blrlounge.in>

Subject: Re: Bill Copies Required : A. M. HASANALI & SONS

Dear Mahesh Sir,
Please provide the inward stamp on invoices.

Thanks & Regards
Md Johiruddin Sk

From: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2024 5:59 PM

To: T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Yuvrajsingh Shekhawat
<yuvrajsingh.shekhawat@travelfoodservices.com>; Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudhir Arora
<sudhir.arora@travelfoodservices.com>; T2 BLR RA <t2blr.ra@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: Bill Copies Required : A. M. HASANALI & SONS

Hi Store Team,

Please take confirmation from RA team about receipt of Goods and share attached bills on SAFAL on priority
and confirm back after submission of bill on SAFAL.

From: accounts (AMHasanali & sons) <accounts@hasanali52.com>
Sent: 14 November 2024 17:54
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To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Bill Copies Required : A. M. HASANALI & SONS

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir/Madam,

Attached soft copy of the Invoices as per your requirement.

Warm Regards,
Pratiksha
Accounts

A.M.Hasanali & Sons

Godown no 2, Krishna Cotton Press,

156, Jakariya Bunder road,

Next to Balmer Lawrie Company,
Sewree (west), Mumbai 400015

Tel: 022 24158290/91
Mob. : 9167966656

From: A.M. Hasanali & Sons [mailto:amh@hasanali52.com]
Sent: 14 November 2024 15:50
To: Amh accounts main <accounts@hasanali52.com>

Subject: FW: Bill Copies Required : A. M. HASANALI & SONS

Importance: High

From: Invoices TFS [mailto:invoices@travelfoodservices.com]

Sent: 14 November 2024 13:09

To: amh@hasanali52.com

Cc: Parag Pandey; Anuj Dubey; Yuvrajsingh Shekhawat; Bangalore Stores; Sonali Dhadve; Santosh. Sawant K-Corp
Subject: Bill Copies Required : A. M. HASANALI & SONS

Importance: High

Hi Sir,
Greetings from the TFS!!,

Would you kindly provide us with the bill copies for given below details, that we discovered on the GST portal?

Invoice No Invoice Date Total GST Invoice Value
Vendor Name (2A/2B) | (2A/2B) (2A/2B) (2A/2B) (2A/2B)
A. M. HASANALI & 23-24/CCI-
SONS 16585 22-Aug-23 | 10,200.00 95,200.00
A. M. HASANALI & 23-24/CClI-
SONS 15790 30-May-23 | 3,162.00 29,512.00

Thanks & regards,
Invoice Helpdesk
Travel Food Services Pvt Ltd
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