27AAACI1610D1ZA

INTERNATIONAL MARKET ASSESSMENT INDIA
PRIVATE LIMITED

1.e-Invoice Details

IRN : 0a257d061b56b1bf5637ec0ac8ff35476 Ack No. : 122421804754884 Ack Date : 13-06-2024 17:39:00
e784claad7b563d62db3204c5276d4b

2.Transaction Details

Supply type Code : B2B Document No. : MH/CFN-006/24-25 IGST applicable despite Supplier and
Recipient located in same State : No

Place of Supply : MAHARASHTRA

Document Type : Tax Invoice Document Date : 13-06-2024

3.Party Details

Supplier : Recipient :

GSTIN : 27AAACI1610D1ZA GSTIN : 27ABICS8699F17]

INTERNATIONAL MARKET ASSESSMENT INDIA PRIVATE LIMITED Semolina Kitchens Private Limited

DEXTRUS, A ¢ 802, CRESCENZO BUILDING, G BLOCK , BANDRA KURLA COMPLEX Shiv Sagar Estate Block A, 1st Floor, Dr Annie Besant
BANDRA EAST Road

MUMBAI 400051 MAHARASHTRA Mumbai Place of Supply: MAHARASHTRA

400018 MAHARASHTRA

4.Details of Goods / Services

SINo|Item Description HSN Quantity|Unit |Unit Discount(Rs)|Taxable Tax Rate(GST + |Other Total
Code Price(Rs) Amount(Rs)|Cess | charges
State Cess +

Cess Non.Advol
1 Payable as subscription fees to IMA |999599 (0 OTH|20000 0 20000 18.00 + 0.00 | |0 23600
India's CFO NXT programme from 0.00 +0
June 24 - May 25

Tax'ble Amt |CGST Amt |[SGST Amt |IGST Amt |CESS Amt |State CESS |Discount |[Other Charges |Round off Amt |Tot Inv. Amt
20000.00 1800.00 1800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 23600.00

Generated By : 27AAACI1610D1ZA 4
Print Date : 13-06-2024 17:39:25 e
122421204754284

Digitally Signed by NIC-IRP
on :2024-06-13 17:39:00




Invoices TFS

From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: 14 June 2024 10:47

To: ‘Aman Agarwal'’; Abhishek Das

Cc: '‘Ameet Koomar'; Anil Nayak; Muskan Somani; Parag Pandey; Invoices TFS
Subject: Tax Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Attachments: einvl_MH_CFN-006_24-25_Semolina Kitchens.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear All,

Tax Invoice enclosed.

Thank you

Himanshi Rathore

Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing
9999165095

Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE | +» IS0 coner

Insight beyond information

From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 13, 2024 1:25 PM

To: 'Aman Agarwal' <aman@casnva.com>; abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com

Cc: 'Ameet Koomar' <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; 'Anil Nayak' <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Muskan Somani' <muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Parag Pandey' <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Invoices TFS'
<invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Dear All,

We have received the UTR. Will share the tax invoice once the payment is reflected.
Thank you

Himanshi Rathore

Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095

Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE | +» IS0 coner

Insight beyond information




From: Aman Agarwal <aman@casnva.com>

Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 1:38 PM

To: abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com

Cc: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore @cfocollective.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Muskan Somani <muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Abhishek,
Do the needful.

Aman
On 06/10/2024 1:09 PM IST Ameet Koomar <ameet.koomar@adani.com> wrote:

+Aman, please get this checked.

Thanks and Regards,

Ameet Koomar

99718 12896

From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 12:27 PM

To: 'Muskan Somani' <muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Anil Nayak' <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Invoices TFS' <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Parag Pandey' <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Importance: High

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Hi,

Kindly share the payment status. We have completed vendor registration.

Thank you

Himanshi Rathore



Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095

Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE | a» PAUSN compuny

Insight beyond information

From: Muskan Somani <muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 5, 2024 12:41 PM

To: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Hi Team,

Please provide update on payment?

Thanks,

Muskan Somani

From: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Sent: 23 May 2024 15:35

To: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Muskan Somani <muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>
Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

+Muskan: Please check and confirm payment.




Thanks and Regards,

Ameet Koomar

99718 12896

From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2024 3:06 PM

To: 'Invoices TFS' <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; 'Anil Nayak' <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

We have submitted the details.

Thank you
Himanshi Rathore
Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095

Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE |+~ [IN0Y coer

Insight beyond information




From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 22, 2024 12:15 PM

To: 'Invoices TFS' <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: 'Ameet Koomar' <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; 'Anil Nayak' <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

We have received the link — will confirm once we have submitted our details.

Thank you
Himanshi Rathore
Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095

Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE |+~ IS0 o

Insight beyond information

From: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 22, 2024 11:20 AM

To: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Cc: 'Ameet Koomar' <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Importance: High

HI MAM,

We have sent an email to you , with a link to the our web portal via the procuresens@safalsoftcom.com email address for vendor creation, Before submitting the final version, kindly save all the data as a draft,
as per below snap and then submit it for final vendor creation




For Support Please Contact on : CITY LINK HOSPITALIT'

support.safal@k-corp.in

Save As Draft Save And Submit For Approval

Thanks & Regards,

Invoice Helpdesk

From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: 22 May 2024 11:13

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: 'Ameet Koomar' <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Importance: High

I You don't often get email from himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi,

Have not received the vendor registration link. Kindly share.

Thank you
Himanshi Rathore
Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095



Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE  +n A0 conorn

From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: Friday, May 17, 2024 12:22 PM

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

Hi,

Have shared details below.

Thank you

Himanshi Rathore

Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095

Website | LinkedIn




On Thu, 16 May 2024 at 15:53, Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi Mam,

Please provide the information below so that we can send you the vendor registration link for the on-boarding procedure

Name of legal Entity : International Market Assessment India Private Limited
Name of Contact Person : Himanshi Rathore
Contact Number: 9999165095

Email Address : himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com

From: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Sent: 16 May 2024 15:40

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Team,

Please process attached payment and share UTR.

Thanks and Regards,

Ameet Koomar

99718 12896



From: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2024 9:50 PM

To: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Subject: RE: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Approved

From: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2024 6:06 PM

To: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>
Subject: FW: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership
Importance: High

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Akshay,

As discussed, please approve below cost.

Particulars Amount (Rs)
Payable as subscription fees 1o IMA India's CFO NXT programme from 20,000.00
June 24 - May 25

CGST @ 9% 1,800.00
SGST @ %% 1.800.00
IGST @ 18% 0.00
(PAN — AAACIE10D)

Total amount in words. Rupees Twenty Three Thousand and Six Hundred 23,600.00
Only

Thanks and Regards,

Ameet Koomar

99718 12896




From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2024 5:54 PM
To: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Cc: 'Leena Narain' <leena.narain@cfocollective.com>; 'Nisha Maurya' <nisha.maurya@cfocollective.com>

Subject: Proforma Invoice: CFO NxT Membership
Importance: High

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Dear Mr Koomar,

Please find enclosed the Proforma Invoice. Hope the same is in order.

Request you to share the UTR with us once the payment is processed.

Bank details are also given below for your reference:

Bank Name: Citibank N.A.
Bank address: Jeevan Bharti Building, 3 Sansad Marg, Connaught Place, New Delhi - 110001
IFSC Code: CITI0000002
Bank Account number: 0341060044
Bank Account name: International Market Assessment India Private Limited
PAN Number: AAACI1610D
GSTIN (Haryana): 06AAACI1610D1ZE
GSTIN (Maharashtra): 27AAACI1610D1ZA
GSTIN (Karnataka): 29AAACI1610D1Z6
Thank you

Himanshi Rathore

Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095

10




Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE | an @O\ VoW compeny

Trsaphir hevinnd] informuation

From: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2024 5:29 PM

To: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com>

Cc: Leena Narain <leena.narain@cfocollective.com>; Nisha Maurya <nisha.maurya@cfocollective.com>

Subject: RE: CFO India: Introducing a peer-group forum for senior finance leaders (direct reports to CFO) - CFO NxT Forum.

Dear Himanshi,

As discussed, please find below details for invoice purpose:

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PRIVATE LIMITED

27ABICS8699F1Z]

Thanks and Regards,

Ameet Koomar

99718 12896

From: Himanshi Rathore <himanshi.rathore @cfocollective.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2024 5:24 PM

To: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Cc: Leena Narain <leena.narain@cfocollective.com>; Nisha Maurya <nisha.maurya@cfocollective.com>

11



Subject: RE: CFO India: Introducing a peer-group forum for senior finance leaders (direct reports to CFO) - CFO NxT Forum.
Importance: High

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Dear Mr Koomar,

Hope you are well.

Thank you for signing-up for the CFO NxT Membership. We will share the Proforma Invoice shortly.

Look forward to hosting you in our programmes.

Thank you

Himanshi Rathore

Associate VP — Community Engagement & Marketing

9999165095

Website | LinkedIn

CFOCOLLECTIVE | »» FISE0Y comoen

From: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2024 5:20 PM

To: himanshi.rathore@cfocollective.com

Subject: RE: CFO India: Introducing a peer-group forum for senior finance leaders (direct reports to CFO) - CFO NxT Forum.

12



Please share invoice for payment with bank details. I have filled the form.

Thanks and Regards,

Ameet Koomar

99718 12896

From: Seema Menon <seema@cfocollective.com>

Sent: Monday, May 6, 2024 11:30 AM

To: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>

Subject: CFO India: Introducing a peer-group forum for senior finance leaders (direct reports to CFO) - CFO NxT Forum.

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Dear Mr Koomar,
Hope you are well.
CFO India (a brand of CFO Collective) has been at the forefront of recognising, the rising stars in finance since 2012; stalwarts who have the potential to grow into the CFO’s role in the next 3-5 years.

As you may be aware, we run a successful CFONEXT100 programme that identifies 100 high potential, emerging CFOs each year. The initiative celebrates exceptional talent and leadership potential and recognises
their contribution to the finance function and the business.

In line with our commitment to nurturing and supporting promising individuals, we are delighted to unveil a pioneering initiative designed for the next generation of finance leaders — CFO NxT in partnership with
IMA India, a programme exclusively curated with high achievers like yourself in mind.

As you may be aware, our organisation, CFO Collective has merged with IMA India, the country's premier business information services company which offers high quality and comprehensive CXO peer networks
(CEO, CFO, CMO, CHRO) with over 2,500 multinationals, domestic, large, and mid-size companies as its clients.

IMA India has been providing business advisory services to organisations for over three decades and enjoys great credibility among CXOs. They are highly respected for their content, insights, and connections.
As part of IMA India, we hope to leverage on the goodwill and are poised to become bigger, better, and stronger.

Understanding the vital role you play in your organisation, we are deeply invested in nurturing your continued success, both in your professional endeavours and personal growth. We are fully committed to
equipping you with the essential tools, knowledge resources, and invaluable connections needed to seamlessly transition into a CXO role. Ever since the launch of this programme in January 2024, we have
250+ members on the forum — who have derived immense value from being a part of this ‘highly-interactive’ peer-group.

Membership value: Unlocking potential through bespoke learning

e CFO NxT programme will offer a transformative learning experience through virtual and in-person modules and workshops that delve into critical areas like Leadership, Personal Growth and
functional areas such as: Treasury Management, Compliance, Financial Markets, Debt Corporate Finance, M&A, Policy & Regulations, Obligations, Emerging Function Trends, Strategic Planning, Risk
Analysis and much more.

e Our vibrant network will offer you a collaborative space to share insights, best practices, and key data points with your peers.
13



e IMA India conducts exclusive benchmarking surveys amongst the constituency and shares findings with its subscribers and the CFO of the company. You'll get access to these reports and the
insights gathered from these will help you calibrate yourself with the industry at large.

e  Our training modules and workshops will bring together a diverse range of industry experts and thought leaders, equipping you with a comprehensive skill set and preparing you for impactful
leadership positions.

Delivering value
e  6-8 virtual briefing modules throughout the year focused on critical leadership/ finance topics.
e An annual in-person networking event over breakfast, coffee, or dinner, fostering knowledge exchange in a relaxed environment.
e Certificate of Learning issued upon successful completion of the annual modules and sessions.

We are keen to invest in your future.

CFO NxT is designed to equip you with the knowledge, expertise, and connections you need to excel in the leadership role. This will ultimately translate to a more robust and future-proof Finance function within
your organisation.

Seize this exclusive opportunity.

Membership is offered at an introductory price of INR 20,000 + GST per person per annum, valid until May 31st, 2024. Fees can be paid individually or by your esteemed organisation. Company
memberships allow for replacement nominations in case of personnel changes, while individual memberships remain with the participant.

Please click here to view the brochure which contains details of the forum along with the list of current members.

To join, please click here to share your details. We will connect with your invoice and payment accordingly.

We are excited to partner you in your professional journey. Together, we can cultivate a thriving future for you, your organisation, and the entire industry.
We look forward to welcoming you to CFO NxT.

Thanks and best regards,

Seema

Seema Menon

Chief Operating Officer | CFO Collective, an IMA Company

M: +91 97403 94000 | W: www.cfo-india.in

A: #13, 1st Floor, 17th Main, Indiranagar - II Stage, Bengaluru - 560008

Click Here to unsubscribe from this newsletter.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure
under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail
and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this
email.
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DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure
under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail
and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this
email.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure
under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail
and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this
email.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure
under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail
and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this
email.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable
law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail
and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable
law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail
and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.
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