Invoices TFS

From: Pankaj Rathi

Sent: 17 April 2024 19:51

To: Invoices TFS

Cc: Parag Pandey

Subject: FW: INVOICE-TFSPL-CERTIFICATES

Attachments: SGC-24-25-012-TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED-CERTIFICATION.pdf

Hi Sawlaram, can you kindly upload this invoice in SAFAL and send it to me for approval.

B/Rgds
Pankaj

From: Ankit Jain <ankit@casgc.in>

Sent: Wednesday, April 17, 2024 6:20 PM

To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FWD: INVOICE-TFSPL-CERTIFICATES

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

fyi

Thanks & Regards
Ankit Jain

From: "Parwati Singh" <parwatisingh.sgco@gmail.com>
Sent: 4/17/24 6:07 PM

To: Ankit Jain <ankit@casgc.in>
Subject: INVOICE-TFSPL-CERTIFICATES

FYI

In case of any queries, feel free to revert.

Parwati Singh
+91 9821697876
022- 40214937 / 42661638



