Nimisha Jadhav

From: Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com>

Sent: 26 April 2024 04:21

To: Nimisha Jadhav; Nazrul Mondal

Cc: binu.balachandran; prerak@distinctindia.in; Jogeswar Sahu; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp; Shadab Sukri; Stephen P; Sonali Dhadve
Subject: Re: Bhubaneswar Airport || Invoices

Attachments: Invoice 40_Revised.pdf; Invoice 44_Revised.pdf; Invoice 41_Revised.pdf; Invoice 39_Revised.pdf; BBSR_Extra Work_|ltem-wise_Qty

Difference.xlsx

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear (@Nimisha Jadhav Ma'am,

As per our discussion with Nazrul sir, sending you updated invoices billed as per original PO values.
Requesting you to kindly check and take these forward.

(@Nazrul Mondal Sir,

Attaching the item wise split in excel format for your reference for all extra work done for the BBSR site.
Requesting your support to generate a separate PO for the same so that invoicing for this can also be done.

Regards,

Sanjay Jain

+91-98102 60645

Distinct India Enterprises LLP

On Sat, Apr 20, 2024 at 4:14 PM Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi All,

Requesting your support to close this.



This has been pending since quite some time now.

Regards,
Sanjay Jain

On Thu, Apr 18, 2024, 2:16 PM Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear (@Nimisha Jadhav Ma'am,

Kindly update on payment status for all the invoices.

(@Nazrul Mondal Sir,

For below points highlighted by Nimisha Ma'am, we have raised invoices as per approved quantities. Requesting your inputs on this matter to close it on
priority.

Attaching Final Signed MBs and abstract for your reference.

Regards,

Sanjay Jain

+91-98102 60645

Distinct India Enterprises LLP

On Fri, Apr 12, 2024 at 2:06 PM Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Nazrul,

Please find below comment

Invoice no 39, 040,041,043 - exceed PO value, kindly send revised invoice with PO value along with certified documents.



PO no 048 679874.7
invoice value 732332.07
Exceed Value 52457.37
PO.no.059 88500
Invoice value (Invoice no.40) 97328
Exceed Value 8828
PO.no.060 25075
Invoice value (Invoice no.41) 32339
Exceed Value 7264
PO.no.0121 95639
Invoice value (Invoice no.43) 95652
Exceed Value 13

From: Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2024 4:27 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; prerak@distinctindia.in; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>;
Nazrul Mondal <nazrulmondal.84 @gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Bhubaneswar Airport | | Invoices




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ma'am,

These invoices were sent with initial email on 08th Mar, 2024.
Sending them again.

Requesting you to please process these and release the payment as soon as possible.

Regards,
Sanjay Jain
+91-98102 60645

Distinct India Enterprises LLP

On Wed, Apr 10, 2024 at 12:24 PM Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,



| have not received any invoices please submit invoices .

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav

From: Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2024 9:21 AM

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; prerak@distinctindia.in; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>;
Nazrul Mondal <nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Bhubaneswar Airport | | Invoices

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear @Nimisha Jadhav Ma'am,




Reminder - 3.

Please confirm the payment release timelines or ETA.

Regards,
Sanjay Jain
+91-98102 60645

Distinct India Enterprises LLP

On Fri, Apr 5, 2024 at 5:29 PM Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear (@Nimisha Jadhav Ma'am,

Gentle reminder.

Requesting you inputs on the payment release.

Regards,
Sanjay Jain



+91 98102 60645
Distint India Enterprises LLP

On Wed, 3 Apr, 2024, 11:03 am Sanjay Jain, <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear (@Nimisha Jadhav Ma'am,

Kind Reminder.

Please confirm payments against Invoices for below mentioned POs

TFSPL/PO/23-24/000048
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000059
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000060
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000061
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000121

TFSPL/PO/23-24/000123

Regards,
Sanjay Jain

+91-98102 60645



Distinct India Enterprises LLP

On Wed, Mar 20, 2024 at 1:15 PM Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear sir/ma'am,

Kindly update on the payment status.

Regards,

Sanjay Jain

On Fri, Mar 15, 2024, 6:14 PM Nazrul Mondal <nazrulmondal.84(@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Nimisha,

Please update of payment status.

Thanks,



Nazrul

On Fri, Mar 8, 2024, 2:49 PM Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in> wrote:

Nazrul,

Kindly have this submitted

Regards

Binu Balachandran

+91-8452876061

From: Sanjay Jain <di.sanjayjain@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, March 8, 2024 7:10 AM

To: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Nazrul Mondal <nazrulmondal.84 @gmail.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-
corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sonali Dhadve
<Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: prerak@distinctindia.in

Subject: Bhubaneswar Airport || Invoices




Dear All,

Please find the attached Invoices against the below POs for which work was executed at Prep Kitchen, Curry Kitchen & Cafeccino outlets at
Bhubaneswar Airport.

TFSPL/PO/23-24/000048
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000059
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000060
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000061
TFSPL/PO/23-24/000121

TFSPL/PO/23-24/000123

Invoicing has been done according to the final approved quantities and rates.

Requesting you to kindly confirm the receipt of the same.

Regards,

Sanjay Jain
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+91-98102 60645

Distinct India Enterprises LLP
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