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E Outlook

RE: Abstracts & Invoices for AHM food court final bill_Dhaba_ldli.com HVAC _Nourish _Idli.com

From Urmila Jadhav <urmila,jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Date Tue 15/10/2024 16:35

To Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>;

Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe
<santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>

0 21 attachments (13 MB)

Rev.Final Invoice 24251023 Inventech Semolina Kitchens_IDLI.COM_Food court_Ahmedabad Airport.pdf; Rev.Final Invoice
24251024 Inventech Semolina Kitchens_Nourish_Food court_Ahmedabad Airport.pdf; Rev.Final Invoice 24251025 Inventech
Semolina Kitchens_HVAC and Fre IDLI.COM_Food court_Ahmedabad Airport.pdf; Final Invoice 24251022 Inventech Semolina
Kitchens_Dhaba_Food court_Ahmedabad Airport.pdf; Abstract _IDL.COM HVAC_Food court Ahmedabad_14-10-24.xlsx; Abstract
_IDLI.COM_Food court Ahmedabad_14-10-24.xIsx; Abstract _Nourish_Food court Ahmedabad_14-10-24.xIsx; Abstract
_Dhaba_Food court Ahmedabad_14-10-24_Final Bill.xIsx; Dhaba Plumbing.pdf; Dhaba Civil & interior.pdf; Dhaba Electrical.pdf;
IDLI.COM Civil & interior.pdf; IDLI.COM Electrical.pdf; Nourish Plumbing.pdf; Nourish Civil & interior.pdf; Nourish Electical.pdf;
IDLI.COM sprinkler.pdf; Nourish sprinkler.pdf; Dhaba Sprinkler.pdf; HVAC High side.pdf; HVAC Low side.pdf;

Dear Nimisha Mam,

Please find attached revised invoices (Final Bills) of AHM food court outlets (Dhaba, Idli.com, Nourish, Idli.com
HVAC) with supporting documents to proceed further.

Thanks & Regards,
Urmila Jadhav.

From: Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>

Sent: 15 October 2024 14:09

To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>;
Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Abstract sheet for AHM food court final bill

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Urmila,
Please find revised invoices as per shared abstract sheet.

Thanks & Regards,
SAndeep
Inventech Solutions
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On Tue, 15 Oct 2024 at 12:15, Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav(@travelfoodservices.com™> wrote:

Dear Sitaram & Sandeep,

As discussed on call, PFA revised abstracts for AHM food court outlets & share the revised invoices to proceed
further.

Thanks & Regards,
Urmila Jadhav.

From: Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net>
Sent: 15 October 2024 09:50

To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shirish Awati <shirish@inventechsolutions.net>

Subject: Re: Abstract sheet for AHM food court final bill

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Urmila,

As discussed please share the final abstract for final blis for AHM food court accordingly i can change
in invoice and share with Nimisha.

Thanks & Regards,
SAndeep
Inventech Solutions

On Tue, 8 Oct 2024 at 17:21, Sandeep Suryawanshi <sandeep@inventechsolutions.net> wrote:

Dear Urmila,
Please find corrected Abstract sheet for AHM food court final bill.

Thanks & Regards,
SAndeep
Inventech Solutions
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