TAX INVOICE
M/S JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE

v,

ORIGINAL FOR RECIPIENT

GSTIN 19ATGPJ3421R1Z8 PAN ATGPJ3421R / ['t l‘bl LLf
32/114 ! \bo "“
NEW CORD ROAD,, MULAJORE NUTUN PARA, ATHPUR, ) OND\" ;
North Twenty Four Parganas, WEST BENGAL, 743128 o 4

Mobile +91 8697739690 Email info. jagannathenterprlse@gman com

Invoice #: JE/24-25/-76 Invoice Date: 11 Sep 2024

Customer Details: Billing Address:

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES KOLKATA PRIVATE 83, Gate no. 3C, N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL

LIMITED AIRPORT VIP Road

GSTIN: 1T9AAECT8193L1ZJ Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum
Kolkata, WEST BENGAL, 700052

Place of Supply:
19-WEST BENGAL

Due Date: 11 Sep 2024

Shipping Address:

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES KOLKATA PRIVA-
TE LIMITED

83, Gate no. 3C, N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL
AIRPORT VIP Road

Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum
Kolkata, WEST BENGAL, 700052

# ltem Rate / Item Qty Taxable Value Tax Amount Amount
SS Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (1.56"x-
/ 1.5"x18") 650.00 1 NOS 650.00 117.00 (18%) 767.00
HSN: 7323
SS Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (1"x1"x-
/ 36") 650.00 2 NOS 1,300.00 234.00 (18%) 1,634.00
HSN: 7323
sSS Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (1"x1"-
/3/ x73") 750.00 1NOS 750.00 135.00 (18%) 885.00
HSN: 7323
SS Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (1."x1"x-
/ 73" 1,350.00 1NOS 1,350.00 243.00 (18%) 1,593.00
HSN: 7323
SS Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (1"x1"x-
/ 122") 1,850.00 6 NOS 11,100.00  1,998.00 (18%) 13,098.00
HSN: 7326
/ SS Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (1"x1"x-
6 84") 1,750.00 1NOS 1,750.00 315.00 (18%) 2,065.00
HSN: 7323
S8 Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (1"x1"x-
/ 48") 725.00 2 NOS 1,450.00 261.00 (18%) 1,711.00
HSN: 7323
85 Kona Gaurd supply & fixing (5.5"x1-
/B/ .5"x110-") 3,250.00 1NQS 3,250.00 585.00 (18%) 3,835.00
HSN: 7323
S Y & FIXING ~(4" ,
/9’ SS PLATE SUPPLY & FIXING -(4"X93) 2,650.00 1NOS 2,650.00 477.00 (18%) 3,127.00
HSN: 7323
$S PLATE SUPPLY &FIXING (5.5"X78") 2,750.00 1NOS 2,750.00 495.00 (18%) 3,245.00
HSN: 7323
M/ Taxable Amount ¥27,000.00
@ 3 aves | kot Ji W ud & WJidd, A ; 3. Ly Lk i'ia"er CGST 9.0% ?2,430.00
| \,\ ' SECURITY IN-WWAL g D J SGST 9.0% %2,430.0C
/ : htry No. 61§
e\ Y - 2] Total %31,860.0C

Total items / Gty : 10;17000 ate .. U)'f?}z?

. ﬂTEﬁh&’ﬁ&W, r&;l'd\S} INR Thirty-One Thousand, Eight Hundred And Sixty Rupees Only

T e LA p L RN

Page1/2  Thisis adigitally signed document.

Amount Payable:

¥31,860.0(



For M/S JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE

CANARA BANK
nt #: 97073070002972
- Code: CNRB0019707
ranch: SHYAMNAGAR
Authorized Signatory
Notes:
None
Terms and Conditions:

1) JOB DONE WITHIN 2 TO 3 WEEKS FROM THE DATE OF ORDER & ADVANCE .

2) FREIGHT EXTRA AT ACTUAL PAID BY CUSTOMER . .

3) PAYMENT : 70% ADVANCE ALONG THE ORDER & BALANCE 30% AFTER INVOICE SUBMITED .

4)INTEREST @ 24% PER ANNUM WILL BE CHARGED IF PAYMENT NOT MAKE WITHIN 30 DAYS FROM BILL DATE.
5) PAYMENT SHOULD BE MADE BY A/C PAYEE CHEQUE/ONLINE TRANSFER

6) ALL SUBJECT TO BARRACKPORE JURISDICTION.

Receiver's Signature

Page2/2 Thisis adigitally signed document.



‘/ Gma il JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>

. Fwd: Food Court 1 SS Kona Guard Quotation

JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com> Wed, Sep 11, 2024 at 11:38 AM
To: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>

-——— Forwarded message ---------

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>

Date: Fri, Aug 23, 2024 at 12:09 PM

Subject: Food Court 1 SS Kona Guard Quotation

To: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE < info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com >

FYI

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

tis

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 23 August 2024 11:51

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Food Court 1 SS Kona Guard Quotation

ok
CELEARATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
VEARS
L AT - k3 e
K,‘ HEEEA4t e - e e

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 23 August 2024 11:46

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Food Court 1 SS Kona Guard Quotation

Dear Sir,

Please approved Food court-1 SS Kona guard & roll tawa back side SS plate fixing work quotation.



With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das

Travel Food Services

From: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>
Sent: 23 August 2024 11:17

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservioes.com>
subject: Fwd: Food Court 1 SS Kona Gaurd Quotation

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organizatffi)n. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

e —

-

Best Regards

S.R. Basak
Jagannath Enterprise
Mob-8697739690

s - Forwarded message ~——-

From: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 5 Aug, 2024, 12:52 pm

Subject: Food Court 1 SS Kona Gaurd Quotation

To: Chandan Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Sir,

Please find attached Quotation.

Best Regards

S.R. Basak
Jagannath Enterprise
Mob-8697739690



