TAX INVOICE

ORIGINAL FOR RECIPIENT

M/S JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE

GSTIN 19ATGP3421R128 PAN ATGPJ3421R

321114

NEW CORD ROAD,, MULAJORE NUTUN PARA, ATHPUR, L

North Twenty Four Parganas, WEST BENGAL,

743128 o -3

Mobile +31 8697739690 Email Info.iagannathcnterprise@gﬁ‘:ail.c:om

Invoice #: JE[24-25(-56 Invoice Date: 13 Aug 2024 bue Date: 13 Aug 2024

Customer Details: Billing Address: : _ Shipping Address:

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES KOLKATA PRIVATE 83, Gate no. 3C, N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES KOLKATA PRIVA-

LIMITED AIRPORT VIP Road TE LIMITED

GSTIN: 19AAECTS193L1ZS Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum 83, Gate no. 3C, N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL
Kolkata, WEST BENGAL, #00052 AIRPORT VIP Road

Place of Supply:
19-WEST BENGAL

Kazi Nazrul Isfam Sarani, Dum Bum
Kolkata, WEST BENGAL, 700052

# ftem Rate { tem Qty Taxable Value Tax Amount Amount
steef Cabinetin Idii.com 1(37"'x25"x2- _

1 L5 25,500.00 TNOS 25,500.00 4,590.00 (18%) 30,090.00

HSN: 7323

- “ Taxable Amount ¥25,500.00

CGST 9.0% ¥2,295.00

SGST 9.0% ¥2,295.00

Total $30,090.60

Totst ltems [ Gty : 1/1.000 Total amount (in words): INR Thirty Thousand And Ninety Rupees Qnly.

Amount Payable: ¥30,0990.00

Bank Details:

Bank: CANARA BANK
Account #: 97073070002972
FSC Code: CNRBC019707
Branch: SHYAMNAGAR
HNotes:

None

Yerms and Conditions:

1) JOB DONE WITHIN 2 TO 3 WEEKS FROM THE DATE OF DRDER & ADVANCE .

2) FREIGHT EXTRA AT ACTUAL PAID BY CUSTOMER .

3} PAYMENT : 70% ADVANCE ALONG THE ORDER & BALANCE 30% AFTER INVOICE SUBMITED .
AIINTEREST @ 24% PER ANNUM WILL BE CHARGED IF PAYMENT NOT MAKE WITHIN 30 DAYS FROM BILL DAT
5) PAYMENT SHOULD BE MADE BY AfC PAYEE CHEQUE/ONLINE TRANSFER

6} ALL SUBJFCT TO BARRACKPORE JURISDICTION.

Receiver's Signature
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For M/S JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE

ravel Fuot Services Kolkata Pyt. Lia. (IFSKPW
SECURITY IN-\QIAR? =
Sntry No. 3204

Date ....ld loZ [2y...nTire ... s ELE2.
s/ehicle No Authorized Signatory
“acutity Sian (2 ‘51’10




Food Court 1 Marble Top & SS Cabinet Quotation

1 message R

Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
To: info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.com>

Tue, 6 Aug, 2024 at 1+

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent; 06 August 2024 13:10

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodsarvices com»
Subject: RE: Food Court 1 Marble Top & SS Cabinet Quotation

ok

Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972

b .- B W2 SR R R

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 06 August 2024 13:07

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto bose@travelfoodservices.coms>

Subject: Food Court 1 Marble Top & SS Cahinet Quotation

Dear Sir,

Please approved attached Food court-1 Marble top & (dli.com -1 SS cabinet quotation.

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das

Travel Food Services

Afs

From: JAGANNATH ENTERPRISE <info.jagannathenterprise@gmail.coms>

Sent: 05 August 2024 12:53
To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.coms
Subject: Food Court 1 Marble Top & SS Cabinet Quotation



