ORIGINAL
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
MAROBERIA, GOPAL NAGAR PO, KOLAGHAT , WB -721130
Email: jntradingcompany0@gmail.com

Bill of Supply

Bill To Invoice Details
Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata) Invoice No.: 73
N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Road, Kazi Nazrul [slam Date: 23-10-2024
Sarani, Dum Dum, Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052 Time: 01:25 PM

PO date: 22-10-2024
PO number: 21

# Item Name Quantity Price/ UniE e om ol Amount
1 3" DER VAJ KOBZA/HINGES - HEAVY = Pcs 5.00 ?1,375.00
2 Glass Handle 12" 1 Pcs ¥860.00 ¥ 860.00
3 Gypsum Screw 1" 1 Box 2480.00 ¥ 480.00
4 Gypsum Screw 3/4 1 Box ¥350.00 ¥350.00
5 Gypsum Screw 5/8 1 Box ¥340.00 ¥ 340.00
6 Gypsum Screw 1.5" 1 Box ¥550.00 ¥ 550.00
7 Post Box Lock Clamp 6 Pcs ¥ 50.00 ¥ 300.00
8 Lock and key 2 Pcs 35.00 70.00
9 Welding rod 1 Pac ¥1,050.00 ¥ 1,050.00

Total 39 ¥5,375.00
Invoice Amount In Words: Five Thousand Three Hundred and Seventy Five Sub Tota SR
Rupees only Total ¥5,375.00
Terms and conditions: Thank you for doing business with us. il E000

Balance ¥5,375.00
Bank Details For: M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
Name: Bandhan Bank Limited, Paikpari 3
Account No.: 20100029563961 ﬁ (e ﬁ:j
IFSC code: BDBL0001415
Account Holder's Name: J N TRADING COMPANY Authorized Signatory
Acknowledgment
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

Invoice To: Invoice Details:
Travel Food Services Private Limited Invoice No. : 73
(Kolkata) Invoice Date : 23-10-2024

Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum,
Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052

Documents Submission Details:

Travel Food Services Private Ltd

\, M
Location:- M*’Vﬁt Reo ,H-'g REVEN RANCEA

Date:-24Ib( 2 Time:-LFL2 .o INWARD

Employee ID:- jooo & g ( Date : M]Ib]')/f Time ; ...;.\.‘;C..;,&\.’.T.
Name:- -F%M s.No. .83 R& Sian. . Q2.

Department:-—pipAp it ltbs—
RAName & Emp.ID : .......... _— ﬂ;\f[l\ |

Signature:-é‘b ———




Mafﬁl}igl Quotation

From: Chandan Kumar Das
chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com
To: jntradingcompany0@gmail.com
jntradingcompanyO@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October at 4:35 pm

FYI

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@iravelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 22 October 2024 16:24

To: Chandan Kumar Das
<chandan.das@iravelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Material Quotation

ok

CELEARATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972

YEARS

AV T TR ) . e S ik

From: Chandan Kumar Das
<chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 22 October 2024 15:56

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose(@travelfoodservices com>
Subject: Material Quotation '

Dear Sir,
Please approved attached Carpentry materials
quotation.



