ORIGINAL
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
MAROBERIA, GOPAL NAGAR PO, KOLAGHAT , WB -721130
Email: jntradingcompanyO@gmail.com

Bill of Supply

Bill To Invoice Details
Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata) Invoice No.: 77
N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Date: 06-11-2024
Sarani, Dum Dum, Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052 Time: 11:48 AM

~ Item Name F_‘fice/ Unit

1 Greenlam Laminate (5524Sud) 1 ¥ 1,900.00 ¥1,900.00
Total 1 ¥1,900.00
Sub Total ¥1,900.00
Invoice Amount In Words: Two Thousand One Hundred Rupees only R
Shipping ¥200.00
Terms and conditions: Thank you for doing business with us. Total 2,100.00
Received Z0.00
Balance ¥2,100.00
Bank Details For: M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
Name: Bandhan Bank Limited, Paikpari -
Account No.: 20100029563961 7_\ ) 0-\/\9\ )7 ];j
IFSC code: BDBL0001415
Account Holder's Name: J N TRADING COMPANY Authorized Signatory
Acknowledgment
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
Invoice To: Invoice Details:
Travel Food Services Private Limited Invoice No. : 77
(Kolkata) Invoice Date : 06-11-2024

N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORTVIP  |nvoice Amount : 2100.0
Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum, o
Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052 Receivers Seal & Sign
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Gl Outlook

Fw: Laminate Quotation

From Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Date Wed 11/6/2024 2:59 PM

To J.N. TRADING COMPANY <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com>

Cc Kolkata Stores <kolkata.stores@travelfoodservices.com>; Kolkata RA <kolkata.ra@travelfoodservices.com>

Approval mail.

Get Outlook for Android

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 1:17:11 PM

To: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Laminate Quotation
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From: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 06 November 2024 13:03

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: Laminate Quotation

Dear Sir,
Please approve the cost of laminate purchase for carpentry work purposes in domestic lounge.

Get Outlook for Android

From: J. N. TRADING COMPANY <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 11:51:32 AM

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Nazrul Mondal
<nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Laminate Quotation

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata),

Thanks for doing business with us. Below are your quotation(s) details. Please find the quotation attached
for your reference.



Quotation Amount : X 2,100.00
Quotation Number : 23
Quotation Date : 06/11/2024

Thank you,
M/S. JN. TRADING COMPANY



