ORIGINAL
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

MAROBERIA, GOPAL NAGAR PO, KOLAGHAT , WB -721130
Email: jntradingcompany0@gmail.com

Bill of Supply
Bill To Invoice Details
Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata) Invoice No.: 97
N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Date: 09-12-2024
Sarani, Dum Dum, Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052 Time: 01:14 PM

PO date: 09-12-2024
PO number: 40

/1 SS BIT 1/242"+1/2" 28 RFT ¥98.00 32,744.00
Total 28 ¥ 2,744.00
Sub Total ¥2,744.00
Invoice Amount in Words: Two Thousand Seven Hundred and Forty Four

Rupees only Total L4 2,744.00
Terms and conditions; Thank you for doing business with us. Received ity
Balance T2,744.00

Bank Details For: M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

Name: Bandhan Bank Limited, Paikpari

Account No.: 20100029563961 /A Vo, )bt o
IFSC code: BDBLO001415

Account Holder's Name: J N TRADING COMPANY Authorized Signatory

Acknowledgment
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

{nvoice To: Invoice Details:
Travel Food Services Private Limited Invoice No. : 97
(Kolkata) Invoice Date : 09-12-2024

N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Invoice Amount : 27440
Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum, -
Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052 Receiver's Seal & Sign

L ' Tr‘avel Food Services Private Ltd
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RE: Request for Cost Approval for SS Bit

From: Sudipto Bose
sudipto.bose@iravelfoodservices.com

To: Nazrul Mondal
nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das
chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com, J. N. TRADING
COMPANY jntradingcompany0@gmail.com

Sent: Monday 9 December at 10:33 am

ok
CELERRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
hoppiness through food, since 1972
YEARS
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From: Nazrul Mondal
<naziul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com=

Sent: 09 December 2024 09:44

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto bose@travelfoodservices com>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das
<chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; J. N. TRADING
COMPANY <jntradingcompanyQ@gmail. com>

Subject: Fw: Request for Cost Approval for SS Bit

Dear Sir,

Please approve the materials cost@2744/- of SS Bite
for domestic main lounge area.

Thanks,
Nazrul

From: J. N. TRADING COMPANY
<jntradingcompany0@gmail com>

Sent: Monday, December 9, 2024 9:23 AM

To: Chandan Kumar Das

<chandan das@iravelfoodservices com>; Nazrul Mondal
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