M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

MAROBERIA, GOPAL NAGAR PO, KOLAGHAT , WB -721130
Email: jntradingcompany0@gmail.com

ORIGINAL

Bill of Supply

Bill To
Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata)

N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam
Sarani, Dum Dum, Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052

Invoice Details

Invoice No.: 82
Date: 18-11-2024
Time: 10:41 AM

PO date: 15-11-2024
PO number: 33

L&T (Larsen & Toubro Limited) Three Phase

e Sub Meter Corded Electric Lcd Display 10-60A 1 hES B2 A0 ¥ 5350.00
Total 1 ¥ 5,350.00
Sub Total ¥5,350.00
Invoice Amount In Words: Five Thousand Three Hundred and Fifty Rupees
only Total ¥5,350.00
Terms and conditions: Thank you for doing business with us. Received 5000
Balance ¥ 5,350.00
Bank Detgils For: M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
Name: Bandhan Bank Limited, Paikpari .
Account No.: 2010002956396 %\ ) @/\o\ /i?jtj
IFSC code: BDBL0001415 —
Account Holder's Name: J N TRADING COMPANY Authorized Signatory
Acknowledgment

M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

Invoice To: Invoice Details:
Travel Food Services Private Limited Invoice No. : 82
(Kolkata) Invoice Date : 18-11-2024

N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP
Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum,
Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052

Invoice Amount : 5350.0

INWARD

Travel Food Services Private Ltd

ASSURANCEX ‘x

Documents Submission Details:

Date : / UL
S. No.. 1382 .....

RA Name & Emp. ID :

7/ Tme . 2201

Location:- 6“""1
Date:-_{ T e;‘%‘wﬁ %
Employee ID:-_ 10 02tpeg

Name:- St oulty Roy

Department: M—M

S Ky

Signature:-




&

Fw: Meter Quotation.

From: Nazrul Mondal
nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com
To: J. N. TRADING COMPANY
jntradingcompanyO0@gmail.com

Sent: Friday, 15 November at 5:27 pm

Approval copy

Get Outlook for Android

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@iravelioodservices coms>
Sent: Friday, November 15, 2024 4:53:53 PM

To: Nazrul Mondal <pazrul.mondal@iravelfoodservic
Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@
Chandan Kumar Das

<chandan.das(@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Meter Quotation.

ok
CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
— CELL rmemen e @y - At
K

From: Nazrul Mondal
<pazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 15 November 2024 16:49

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelioodservices. com
Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri(@r:
Chandan Kumar Das
<chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: Meter Quotation.

Dear Sir,

Please approve the cost of meter purchase for Qmin
Outlet.

Thanks,
Nazrul Mondal



al

.Get,Qutlook for Android

From: J. N“TRADING COMPANY

<Jntrad|ngmmamyg@gmall com>

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2024 4:23:17 PM

To: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul mondals atravelfoodservices.com>
‘Subject: Meter Quotation. ' :

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization.
Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata),

Thanks for doing business with us. Below are your
quotation(s) details. Please find the quotation
attached for your reference.

Quotation Amount : ¥ 5,350.00
Quotation Number: 33 -
Quotation Date : 15/11/2024

Thank you, .
M/S. ].N. TRADING COMPANY
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