M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

MAROBERIA, GOPAL NAGAR PO, KOLAGHAT , WB -721130
Email: jntradingcompanyO@gmail.com

ORIGINAL

Bill of Supply

Bill To
Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata)

N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam
Sarani, Dum Dum, Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052

Invoice Details

Invoice No.: 75
Date: 30-10-2024
Time: 11:08 AM

PO date: 18-10-2024
PO number: 20
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#  ftemName e Quantity  Uni rice
1 Dry up protecto!' 183?C Item code:40.01.329S 1 Pcs %7,950.00 £7.950.00
(Rational Combi)
Total 1 ¥7,950.00
Sub Total ¥7,950.00
Invoice Amount In Words: Seven Thousand Nine Hundred and Fifty Rupees
only Total ¥7,950.00
Terms and conditions: Thank you for doing business with us. Received RA00
) - Balance ¥7,950.00
\'\
Bank Details For: M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
Name: Bandhan Bank Limited, Paikpari
17
Account No.: 2010002956396 /A @/‘0\ /ﬂjc*’\
IFSC code: BDBL0001415 ~J
Account Holder's Name: J N TRADING COMPANY Authorized Signatory
Acknowledgment

M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

Invoice To: Invoicé Details:
Travel Food Services Private Limited Invoice No. : 75
(Kolkata) Invoice Date : 30-10-2024

N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Invoice Amount : 7950.0
Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum,
Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052

Receiver's Seal & Sign

Travel Food Services Private Ltd
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M Gmail

J. N. TRADING COMPANY <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com>

wsz_" Fw: Approval required for Rational Combi mwm_.m Parts

J. N. TRADING COMPANY <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com>
Draft To: "J. N. TRADING COMPANY" <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com>

Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 11:20 AM

Forwarded message
From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Date: Mon, Oct 21, 2024 at 10:17 AM

Subject: Fw: Approval required for Rational Combi Spare Parts

io: ntradingcompanyD@gmail.com  <jntradingcompany0@gmaill.com>

FYl

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

Als

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 20 October 2024 14:36

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Approval required for Rational Combi Spare Parts

Ok

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Friday, October 18, 2024 5:09:24 PM

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Approval required for Rational Combi Spare Parts

Dear Sir,
Please approved attached copper combi oven spare parts quotation.

1 4
With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services
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From: . N. TRADING COMPANY <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com>
Sent: 18 October 2024 15:10

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.coms; Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@

travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Rational Combi Spare Parts

CAUTION: This emait orlginated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or apen attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content Is safe,

Dear Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata),

Thanks for doing business with us. Below are your quotation(s) details. Please find the quotation attachec for your
reference.

Quotation Amount : ¥ 7,950.00
Quotation Number : 20
Quotation Date : 18/10/2024

Thank you,
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY




