ORIGINAL
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY
MAROBERIA, GOPAL NAGAR PO, KOLAGHAT , WB -721130
Email: jntradingcompanyO@gmail.com
Bill of Supply

_ BillTo Invoice Details
Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata) Invoice No.: 104
N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT VIP Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Date: 25-12-2024
Sarani, Dum Dum, Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052 Time: 08:14 PM

PO date: 23-12-2024
PO number: 47

1 ____—P;ice/ -l-J_n |t

Item Name

(“‘ Led Light Track 1 Pcs ¥450.00 ¥450.00
/2’ Saint Gobain heavy glass doub gum tape 1 Pcs ¥825.00 ¥825.00
Total 2 ¥1,275.00
Sub Total ¥1,275.00
Invoice Amount In Words: One Thousand Two Hundred and Seventy Five

Rupees only Total E 4 1,275.00
Terms and conditions: Thank you for doing business with us. gecived S0y
Balance $1,275.00

Bank Details For: M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

Name: Bandhan Bank Limited, Paikpari

%)
Account No.: 2010002956396 //L\ /@/\o\ j;tj

IFSC code: BDBL0001415
Account Holder's Name: J N TRADING COMPANY Authorized Signatory

Acknowledgment
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

Invoice To: Invoice Details:
Travel Food Services Private Limited Invoice No. : 104
(Kolkata) Invoice Date : 25-12-2024

Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum,
Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052

Documenis Sub

Tfavel Food Services Private Ltd

Afs

N e TYTTT VT

Date Q—é’h%q’ff Time : ]ggt)
S. No. 252'7 RA. SigN. ..o

RAName & Emp. ID : @'F)ﬂ* ............

L®
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Track Chanel and double gum tape Quotation
2 messages

J. N. TRADING COMPANY <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com> Mon, 23 Dec, 2024 at 9:58 am
To: Chandan Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>, Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Travel Food Services Private Limited (Kolkata),

Thanks for doing business with us. Below are your quotation(s) details. Please find the quotation attached for your reference.

Quotation Amount : ¥ 1,275.00
Quotation Number : 47
Quotation Date : 23/12/2024

Thank you,
M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com> Mon, 23 Dec, 2024 at 4:45 pm
To: jntradingcompany0@gmail.com <jntradingcompany0@gmail.com>

FYI

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

[

b et e

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@traveifoodservices.com>

Sent: 23 December 2024 13:32

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Kolkata Stores <kolkata.stores@travelfoodservices.coms; Kolkata RA <kolkata.ra@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Track Chanel and double gum tape Quotation

ok

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 23 December 2024 11:13

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Kolkata Stores <kolkata.stores@travelfoodservices.com>; Kolkata RA <kolkata.ra@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Track Chanel and double gum tape Quotation

Dera Sir,

Please approved attached materials list quotation for low-cost counter.
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