M/S. J.N. TRADING COMPANY

MAROBERIA, GOPAL NAGAR PO , KOLAGHAT , WB -721130

Emall; jntradingcompanyS@gmail.com
Bill of Supply
Bill To

Travel Food Services Private Limited

Biju pattanalk international Airport, Alrport Rd, Aerodrome
Area, Bhubaneswar, Odisha 751020

Contact No.: 6291316832

H'm‘ M
Invorce Yo - ££
Dz 050527074
Tome 0522 P

Uit
1 19 MMPLY LOCAL MAKE 8 Pcs 22,720.00 22175000
72 19 MM BLOCK BOARD (8X4) 4 Pcs ¥2950.00 21120000
<4 12MMLOCAL PLYWOOD (8%4) 3 Pcs ¥2.080.00 £524000
% Laminate As per photo 13 Pcs €1,650.00 22145000
/5 FEVICOL 5 KG SPEEDX 1 Nos 21,400.00 27,400.00
“6  HEATX 3 Lir 254000 2142000
% Maskin Tape 6 Pcs ¥340.00 22040.00
6 , 2" Nall . 0.75 Kg 13500 210125
~9~ NENAL 05 Kg 2135.00 267.50
\ J& Headless pin ‘ 1 Box 80.00 Fs0.00
\14-/-1 Hinges 78X27x10 — . _ 24 Pcs 765.00 F1.550.00
~32"  Tower boit4° 12 Pcs ¥98.00 £1,176.60
J2~ Handled 12 Pos £67.00 ¥304.00
¢ 14~ Multi lock Godre] 6 Pcs ¥220.00 ¥1.320.00
.\}5/ Godrej Cupboard Lock As per Sample 6 Nos ¥400.00 ¥2.400.00
A )& 19/6Blackscrew - _ 300 Pes 2085 #105.00
\17"%7Auto hinges 0" Godre) 6 Pcs £98.00 35300
~ 3" DER VAJ KOBZA/HINGES - HEAVY + 12 Pcs 5500 255000
| Total 418.25 IS
) ] Sub Total TIR261.75
:m 2:;;)unt In Words: Seventy Six Thousand and Sixty Two Belivery/Transportation Charge 800,00
Terms and condltions: Thank you for doing business with us. DG taxs
Total 76,062.00
Received 20.00

¥ 3a062.00




12/17/24, 1:12 PM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

[5 Outlook

Fw: Approved Bill

From Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Wed 12/11/2024 4:10 PM
To Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

mj 12 attachments (9 MB)

Document.pdf; 20241211182215.pdf; 20241211182527.pdf; 20241211182548.pdf; 20241211182627.pdf;
20241211182745.pdf; 20241211182828.pdf; 20241211183019.pdf; 20241211183047.pdf; 20241211183105.pdf;
20241211183128.pdf; 20241211183144.pdf;

Dear Rakesh,
PFA of approval bill copy.

Thanks,
Nazrul

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 11 December 2024 14:26

To: Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Approval required

Dear Rakesh,
Please find attachment.

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

e

P

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 11 December 2024 11:53

To: Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Approval required

FYI

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE 1YEXLTMOMWQINDIWNCO5ZTAXLWY QY TM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQADTEMPQ%2B1QRDIx33Rjid8X... 12
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e

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 11 December 2024 11:52

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Approval required

ok

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 11 December 2024 10:43

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Approval required

Dear Sir,
Please approved attached vendor supply materials bill for payment process.

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

s

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE 1YEXLTMOMWQINDIWNCO5ZTAXLWY QY TM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQADfEMPQ%2B1QRDIXx33Rjid8X... 2/2



