Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 03 October 2024 16:19

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shadab Sukri; S Alam Khan; Delhi Project; Prabhat Kumar
Subject: FW: Dilli Streat Purchase order

Attachments: Purchase order for dilli streat.pdf; Dilli_street_RA_bill-1.pdf
Hi Nimisha

Approved 70% can be released as per the work done.

Regards
Ajit Singh

From: S Alam Khan <alam@electechenterprises.net>
Sent: Thursday, October 3, 2024 4:15 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fwd: Dilli Streat Purchase order

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: S Alam Khan <alam(@gelectechenterprises.net>
Date: Tue, 1 Oct 2024 at 17:09




Subject: Dilli Streat Purchase order
To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>
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