


SNo Item Code
HSN\SAC 

Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise
Total Tax 

Amount(ININR)
Total Amount

(ININR)
1 2000128 8418 FLY CATCHER BLUE PAD INSECT KILLERS - Equipment Cleaning EACH 4,700.00 3 18.00 0.00 0 14100.00

Total Unit 3.00
Payment : 100% Advance along with the gst amount and PO Freight : Extra onactual, Lead time : 3-5 Days, Outlet : KFC 
Chennai 

Total Taxable INR 14,100.00

Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 2,538.00

a) Products to be Supplied by 
Supplier at own cost

b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00

c) Delivery schedule to be 
taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 
DELIVERY ADDRESS.

0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will 
be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or 
the GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 16,638.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority.  If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at 
the earliest.  Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.

Page No: 1

Vendor No. V0001280
Purchase Order

Order Number CHN/PO/23-24/001153

Page No: 127-02-2024  18:42:40

Technocrats Security Systems Pvt LtdMUMBAI, 400063IndiaIndia

Shipped Location
CHN KFC INTL T2Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.LtdGround Floor, Second Floor,Anna International ,Chennai Airport,TirusulaCHENNAI, 600027India

Invoice LocationCHN KFC INTL T2Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.LtdGround Floor, Second Floor,Anna International ,Chennai Airport,Tirusula600027IndiaIN

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PRIVATE LIMITEDCentral Kitchen, Next to S2 Police Station ,Chennai International Airport,CHENNAI, 600027
P.A.N. No. AABCT3068M Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 11-07-2023Net 30 days

Corporate Address

State Name Tamil NaduComp GST No. 33AAECT8192M1ZS

33AAECT8192M1ZSGSTIN No.

State 33

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AABCT3068M1ZZVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email accounts@technocrat.asia

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type



Page No: 2

Vendor No. V0001280
Purchase Order

Order Number CHN/PO/23-24/001153

Page No: 227-02-2024  18:42:40

Technocrats Security Systems Pvt LtdMUMBAI, 400063IndiaIndia

Shipped Location
CHN KFC INTL T2Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.LtdGround Floor, Second Floor,Anna International ,Chennai Airport,TirusulaCHENNAI, 600027India

Invoice LocationCHN KFC INTL T2Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.LtdGround Floor, Second Floor,Anna International ,Chennai Airport,Tirusula600027IndiaIN

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PRIVATE LIMITEDCentral Kitchen, Next to S2 Police Station ,Chennai International Airport,CHENNAI, 600027
P.A.N. No. AABCT3068M Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 11-07-2023Net 30 days

Corporate Address

State Name Tamil NaduComp GST No. 33AAECT8192M1ZS

33AAECT8192M1ZSGSTIN No.

State 33

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AABCT3068M1ZZVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email accounts@technocrat.asia

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type
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Smrutika Thoti

From: Gaurav Dewan
Sent: 03 August 2023 12:08
To: Sandeep Bhat
Cc: Salman Khan; Abdul Rehman; Swapnil Sutar; Irfan Sayed; Smrutika Thoti; Lovejot Sekhon; Suraj Kumbhar; Karthick K; Shama Nair
Subject: Re: KFC Chennai T2 PO Approval 

Okay with me 
 
Best, 
 
Gaurav Dewan 
+91 96655 15000 
 
 

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
Date: Wednesday, 26 July 2023 at 1:59 PM 
To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Salman Khan <salman.khan@k-corp.in>, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>, Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>, Irfan Sayed 
<irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>, Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>, Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Suraj Kumbhar 
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>, Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>, Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: KFC Chennai T2 PO Approval  

Dear Sir  
  
Your approval is awaited on KFC Chennai T2 PO  
  

Sr 
No    PO No    Date    Location     Vendor     Item Description      PO Value  

without GST     
   PO Value  
with GST     

1 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001152 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Vensys IT Ventures Pvt Ltd  Panasonic rice cooker                    11,000.00               12,980.00  

2 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001153 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Technocrates  Fly cather machine                    18,800.00               22,184.00  



2

4 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001160 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Mittal international  Pre rinse units flour mounted                   22,950.00               27,081.00  

5 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001161 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Kunal industries  Bonpet                     38,250.00              45,135.00 

6 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001170 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai 

YESBEE FIRE AND SECURITY 
SERVICES FIRE EXTINGUISHER                     43,500.00               51,330.00  

  

From: Sandeep Bhat  
Sent: 17 July 2023 19:35 
To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Salman Khan <salman.khan@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Irfan Sayed 
<irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Suraj Kumbhar 
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: KFC Chennai T2 PO Approval  
Importance: High 
  
Sir  
  
Please Approve KFC Chennai T2 PO  
  

Sr 
No    PO No    Date    Location     Vendor     Item Description      PO Value  

without GST     
   PO Value  
with GST     

1 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001152 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Vensys IT Ventures Pvt Ltd  Panasonic rice cooker                    11,000.00               12,980.00  

2 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001153 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Technocrates  Fly cather machine                    18,800.00               22,184.00  

4 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001160 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Mittal international  Pre rinse units flour mounted                   22,950.00               27,081.00  

5 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001161 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Kunal industries  Bonpet                     38,250.00              45,135.00 

6 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001170 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai 

YESBEE FIRE AND SECURITY 
SERVICES FIRE EXTINGUISHER                     43,500.00               51,330.00  

  

From: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 17 July 2023 18:28 
To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
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Cc: Salman Khan <salman.khan@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Irfan Sayed 
<irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Suraj Kumbhar 
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: KFC Chennai T2 PO Approval  
  
Approved 
  
Regards, 
Shama Nair 
+91 9821053476 
http://www.k-hospitality.com/ 

 
  

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>  
Sent: Friday, July 14, 2023 4:59 PM 
To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Salman Khan <salman.khan@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Irfan Sayed 
<irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Suraj Kumbhar 
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: KFC Chennai T2 PO Approval  
  
Dear Madam  
  
Your approval awaited  
  
  
  

From: Sandeep Bhat  
Sent: 13 July 2023 16:44 
To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Salman Khan <salman.khan@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Irfan Sayed 
<irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Suraj Kumbhar 
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<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: KFC Chennai T2 PO Approval  
  
Dear Madam, 
  
Please Approve KFC Chennai T2 PO  
  

Sr 
No    PO No    Date    Location     Vendor     Item Description      PO Value  

without GST     
   PO Value  
with GST     

1 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001152 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Vensys IT Ventures Pvt Ltd  Panasonic rice cooker                    11,000.00               12,980.00  

2 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001153 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Technocrates  Fly cather machine                    18,800.00               22,184.00  

4 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001160 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Mittal international  Pre rinse units flour mounted                   22,950.00               27,081.00  

5 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001161 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai Kunal industries  Bonpet                     38,250.00              45,135.00 

6 
CHN/PO/23-
24/001170 

11-07-
2023 KFC Chennai 

YESBEE FIRE AND SECURITY 
SERVICES FIRE EXTINGUISHER                     43,500.00               51,330.00  

  


