Toi; Invoice No#24082390
Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd Date: 26-AUG-2024
N.S.C.B.I. Airport Terminal

Departure Level, Gate No. 3C

KOLKATA IN-WB 700052

GSTN No# 19AAFCP6488B175
Kind Attn: Mr/Ms Pan No# AAFCP6488B
Dear Sir,

It was a pleasure having you in our property. We hope you have enjoyed you
to our hotel. We are sending bills for payment with details as summarised
and request to release the same at earliest.

Date Bill No Company/ Guest Name Amount
23/08/24 8389 Mr Abhijeet Saxena 3.360.00
Total Amount _ 3,360.00

Amount in Words Rupees THREE THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED SIXTY ONLY

BILLS TO BE PAYABLE ON PRESENTATION

Note

1. Discrepancies should be intimated within a week.
2. All Dispute subject to West Bengal Jurisdiction
3. Kindly make chegue/DD in favour of PLATINUM WORLD HOSPITALITY 07 R
payable at KOLKATA O

Bank Details

PLATINUM WORLD HOSPITALITY PVT. LTD.
Bank Name: AXIS Bank |
Branch: Baguiati For Platinum World Hospitali
Account No.: 917020053903218 .
IFSC Code: UTIB0000026

MICR Code: 700211007 ‘
Bank Address: Baguiati, Kolkata(WB), Kolkata-700 Accounts Team
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JHoward Johnson 'FSSAI NO-12817013000473
BY WYNDHAM i
: GSTIN : 19AAFCP6488B1Z5
TAXINVOICE PAN NO: AAFCP6488B
Company GST : 19AAECT8193L12ZJ Bill Number : FM6345BIL0008389
Guest Name : Mr Abhijeet Saxena Bill Date - 23/08/2024
2nd Guest Name : Room No : 103
Other Guest Name : Reg No : 10868
Company Name ; Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd Reservation # - 67758
Address : N.S.C.B.l. Airport Terminal Departure Number of Pax s 4
Level, Gate No. 3C Kolkata — 700 052 Arrival Date - 22/08/2024 19:30
KOLKATA 700052 Departure Date 1 23/08/2024 10:00
IN-WB IN Plan CP
Date Ref No Description Room# SAC Amount Advance Balance
22/08/24 Tariff 103 996311 3,000.00 0.00 0.00
22/08/24 State GST @ 6.0% 180.00 0.00 0.00
22/08/24 Central GST @ 6.0% 180.00 0.00 0.00
22/08/24 Total: __ 3,360.00
Grand Total: 3,360.00 0.00 3,360.00
Net Amount: 3,360.00

In Words: Rupees Three Thousand Three Hundred Sixty Only

Tax Summary

Tax Details Tax Amount
Central GST @ 6.00% 180.00
State GST @ 6.00% 180.00
Total Tax Collected 360.00

| AGREE TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE BILL AND AM
RESPONSIBLE FOR THE FULL PAYMENT OF THIS BILL IN THE EVENT IS
NOT PAID BY THE COMPANY ORGANISATION OR PERSON INDICATED

PLEASE DEPOSIT YOUR ROOM KEY CARD.
MISSING OF ROOM KEY CARD IS CHARGEABLE.

hijeet Saxena

ABHUITB

F.O.E/F.0.A. Guest Signature
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HOWARD JOHNSON KOLKATA(Unit: Platinum World Hospitality Pvt. Ltd.)
New Town Square ;Chinar Park ;Atghara ;Kolkata-700136
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8/22/24, 9:27 pp T : HOWARD JOHNSON KOLKATA Mail - Re: FW: Room Booking for TFS
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Re: FW: Room Booking for TFS

1 message

oo e ot e i T,

Hojo Reservations <reservati0ns@hojokolkata.com> 20 August 2024 at 12

To: Sreashi Chakraborty <sreashi.chakraborty@traveIfoodservi.cés;com:'- £
Cc: Saptarshi Chakrabo'rty <ho_s@hojokolkata.com>, Arita Sen ﬁom@héjokolkata.coma Account Receivable
<ar@hojokolkata.com>, Ravi Prakash <fc@hojokolkata.com>, safes?@hojokolkata.com, HojoKolkata Frontoffice
<frontofﬁce@hojokoIkata.co‘r‘n> .

Dear Mam/sir

Greetings from HoWard Johnson By Wyndham, Kolkata!

friendly smile. Please find the attached reservation confirmation voucher along with a welcome letter & self
declaration form for your kind perusal. 4

Payment link: https:fiho‘ward}ohnsonkolkata.hotelpay.co.in!
Kindly share the trans_acti'on details once pPayment is done. g :

Note:

Should you /your company wish to claim Input Tax Credit on our Invoices, Please ensure that the

relevant GSTIN ..ﬂﬁmbﬂs*_albng with the appropriate Invoicing details like company name/address etc.
are communicated to us at the time of booking or before 01 week of materialization of booking. It is
important to note that the procedure set by the GST network/portal requires us to upload invoices
with GSTIN numbers prior to check out, Post check-out of rooms or settlement of POS invoices we will
1ot be able to accept or entertain any changes in GST E-INVOICE,

Please feel free to contact us for any further assistance.
Thank You

Thanking You,

go happy go hojo
Warm Regards.

Nivedita Poddar

hitps://mail.qooale. comimaitisinini. .
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From: SAPTARSHI CHAKRABORTY~ (DOS- HOWARD JOHNSON KOLKATA) <hos@hojokolkata.com>
Sent: 20 August 2024 11:25 oG

To: Biswajit Biswas <sales1 @hojokolkata.com> :

Subject: Fwd: Room Booking for TFS

---------- Forwarded message --------- Gt

From: Sreashi Chakraborty <sreashi.chakraborty@traveifooct'serviCes,cem>

Date: Tue, 20 Aug, 2024, 11:23 am ‘ i

Subject: Room Booking for TFS :

To: reservations@hojokolkata.com <reservations@hojokolkata com>

Cc: Saptarshi Chakraborty~ (DOS- Howard Johnson Kolkata <hos@hojokofkata.c:om>, Sweta Sen
<sweta.sen@travelfoodservices.com>

Hi,
Please book the room as per below details:
Guest Name: Abhijeet Saxeha
Check in: 22-Aug-24 (Afternoon he will be reaching)
Check out: 23-Aug-24 (Post-lunch)
- Only Accommodation, bill to company.
| -Regards,
Sreashi Chakraborty

Sr. Executive HR :
TFS Kolkata .

&y 67758.pdf
215K




RE: FW: Room Booking for TFS

Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Mon 8/26/2024 12:42 PM

To:Sreashi Chakraborty <sreashi.chakraborty@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc:Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com>;Sweta Sen <sweta.sen@travelfoodservices.com>;Invoices Kolkata
<invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

ok
CELEBRATING
Creating memeries and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
TEARE
viwiilar’ IR - i g s
K -

From: Sreashi Chakraborty <sreashi.chakraborty@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 26 August 2024 12:24

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com>; Sweta Sen <sweta.sen@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices
Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: FW: Room Booking for TFS

Dear Sir,
FYI.
Requesting you to approve the same.

-Regards,

Sreashi Chakraborty
Sr. Executive HR
TFS Kolkata

From: Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com>

Sent: 26 August 2024 12:21

To: Sreashi Chakraborty <sreashi.chakraborty@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Saptarshi Chakraborty <hos@hojokolkata.com>; Ravi Prakash <fc@hojokolkata.com>; sales1@hojokolkata.com
Subject: Re: FW: Room Booking for TFS

'You don't often get email from ar@hojokolkata.com. Learn why this is important
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ma'am,
Kindly find the soft copy of invoices as per requirements.

go happy go hojo
Warm Regards,

Tulika Mandal
Sr. Finance Associate

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata



New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136
West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099

Email id . ar@hojokolkata.com
Website : www.hojokolkata.com

On Tue, Aug 20, 2024 at 12:33 PM Hojo Reservations <reservations@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Mam/sir
Greetings from Howard Johnson By Wyndham, Kolkata!

Thank you for making a reservation with us. We look forward to welcoming you at Howard Johnson By
Wyndham,Kolkata. You have made a great choice by selecting us where you are welcomed by cheery
greetings, a friendly smile. Please find the attached reservation confirmation voucher along with a
welcome letter & self declaration form for your kind perusal.

Payment link: https://howardjohnsonkolkata.hotelpay.co.in/

Kindly share the transaction details once payment is done.

Note:

Should you/your company wish to claim Input Tax Credit on our Invoices, Please ensure that the
relevant GSTIN numbers along with the appropriate invoicing details like company name/address etc.
are communicated to us at the time of booking or before 01 week of materialization of booking. It is
important to note that the procedure set by the GST network/portal requires us to upload invoices with
GSTIN numbers prior to check out. Post check-out of rooms or settlement of POS invoices we will not be
able to accept or entertain any changes in GST E-INVOICE.

Please feel free to contact us for any further assistance.

Thank You



Thanking You,

go happy go hojo
Warm Regards,

Nivedita Poddar
Reservation Assistant

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata

New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall, Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136, West Bengal, India.
| Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000|

Fax:+91 33 6655 7099 | Mobile Number :+91 76040 11004 Mobile Number :+91 76040
11005 Email address: reservations@hojokolkata.com | Website :www.hojokolkata.com

On Tue, 20 Aug 2024 at 11:36, <salesl@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Team,

Kindly find the below query shared by guest .
Room Tariff in attached email .

Thanking You,
go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Biswajit Biswas

Sales Manager

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata

New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136,West Bengal,
India.

Mobile Number : 07604011033 | Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 336655 7099 | Email address : salesl @hojokolkata.com | Website :_www.hojokolkata.com

Events Come Alive

at Howard Johnson Kolkata




From: SAPTARSHI CHAKRABORTY~ (DOS- HOWARD JOHNSON KOLKATA)
<hos@hojokolkata.com>

Sent: 20 August 2024 11:25

To: Biswajit Biswas <sales1(@hojokolkata.com>

Subject: Fwd: Room Booking for TFS

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sreashi Chakraborty <sreashi.chakraborty(@travelfoodservices.com>

Date: Tue, 20 Aug, 2024, 11:23 am

Subject: Room Booking for TFS

To: reservations@hojokolkata.com <reservations@hojokolkata.com>

Cc: Saptarshi Chakraborty~ (DOS- Howard Johnson Kolkata <hos@hojokolkata.com>, Sweta Sen
<sweta.sen@travelfoodservices.com>

Hi,
Please book the room as per below details:
Guest Name: Abhijeet Saxena

Check in: 22-Aug-24 (Afternoon he will be reaching)
Check out: 23-Aug-24 (Post-lunch)

Only Accommodation, bill to company.

-Regards,

Sreashi Chakraborty
Sr. Executive HR
TFS Kolkata



