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FSSAI NO-12817013000473

GSTIN: 19AAFCP6488B1Z5
TAX INVOICE PAN NO: AAFCP6488B
Company GST 19AAECT8193L12J Bill Number : FM6345BIL0001801
Guest Name Mr Nikhil Bhushan Bill Date : 30/04/2024
2nd Guest Name Room No : 407
Other Guest Name Reg No : 2461
Company Name Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd Reservation # - 62711
Address N.S.C.B.l. Airport Terminal Departure Number of Pax i1
Level, Gate No. 3C Kolkata — 700 052 Arrival Date 1 29/04/2024 14:50
KOLKATA 700052 Departure Date - 30/04/2024 11:59
IN-WB IN Plan :CP
Date Ref No Description Room# SAC Amount Advance Balance
29/04/24 Tariff 407 996311 3000.00 0.00 0.00
29/04/24 State GST @ 6.0% 180.00 0.00 0.00
29/04/24 Central GST @ 6.0% 180.00 0.00 0.00
29/04/24 Total: 3360.00
Grand Total: 3360.00 0.00 3360.00
Net Amount: 3360.00
In Words: Rupees Three Thousand Three Hundred Sixty Only
Tax Summary
Tax Details Tax Amount
Central GST @ 6.00% 180.00
State GST @ 6.00% 180.00
Total Tax Collected 360.00
Settlement Details:
A/R Settlements / COMKLTF / Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd / INR / 3360.00

| AGREE TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE BILL AND AM

PLEASE DEPOSIT YOUR ROOM KEY CARD.
MISSING OF ROOM KEY CARD IS CHARGEABLE.

PUJADB
F.O.E/F.0.A.

Mr Nikhil Bhushan

RESPONSIBLE FOR THE FULL PAYMENT OF THIS BILL IN THE EVENT IS
NOT PAID BY THE COMPANY ORGANISATION OR PERSON INDICATED

Guest Signature

HOWARD JOHNSON KOLKATA(Unit: Platinum World Hospitality Pvt. Ltd.)

New Town Square ;Chinar Park ;Atghara ;Kolkata-700136
Ph. No.: +91 33 6655 7000 Email: reservations@hojokolkata.com ;Web: www.hojokolkata.com

Page 1 of 1




6/27/24, 10:37 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

FW: INVOICE SOFT COPY

Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com>
Wed 6/26/2024 4:59 PM

To:Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

0 1 attachments (119 KB)
FW: INVOICE SOFT COPY;

Dear Avirup,

Please process the bill.

Regards,

Arun Kanti Patra | Sr. Manager HR | 6292126644

From: Sudipto Bose sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2024 4:31 PM

To: Arun Patra arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com
Subject: RE: INVOICE SOFT COPY

ok

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972

o N B A ewmiven

YEARS

From: Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 26 June 2024 15:35

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: INVOICE SOFT COPY

Dear Sudipto,

Have checked the details, please approve.

Regards,

Arun Kanti Patra | Sr. Manager HR | 6292126644

From: Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2024 2:50 PM

To: Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ravi Prakash <fc@hojokolkata.com>; Debarshi Sanyal <gm@hojokolkata.com>; Ranjit Roy Choudhury <hos@hojokolkata.com>
Subject: Re: INVOICE SOFT COPY

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. ..
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6/27/24, 10:37 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

Please find the attached soft copy of the invoice which is pending.
go happy go hojo
Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000

Fax: +91 33 6655 7099

Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com
Howard Johuson

EY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Square, Beside Spencer Mall, Chinar Park |
Atghara, Kolkata 700136 INDIA 5
P! 48133 6655 7000 » F! +31 33 6655 7099
hojokalkata.com | info@hojokolkata com

=

HOWARD JOHNSON
ELTEIL T

L=

|| Sl /' (®WATCH VIDEO

to put safety first

On Wed, Jun 26, 2024 at 11:08 AM Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Deep,

Please share the invoice.

Regards,

Arun Kanti Patra | Sr. Manager HR | 6292126644

From: Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com>

Sent: Saturday, June 22, 2024 10:50 AM

To: Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ravi Prakash <fc@hojokolkata.com>; Debarshi Sanyal <gm@hojokolkata.com>; Ranjit Roy Choudhury <hos@hojokolkata.com>
Subject: Re: INVOICE SOFT COPY

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. .. 2/12



6/27/24, 10:38 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please update our outstanding (Rs.3360/-) payment details.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000

Fax: +91 33 6655 7099

Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com
Website : www.hojokolkata.com

HHoward Johnson
BY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Sguare, Beside spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700126 INDIA

P! 48133 6655 7000 « F. +9] 33 6655 7099
hejokolkata.com | info@hojokolkata.com

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

|| Count on Us’ (® WATCH VIDEO

to put safety first

On Wed, May 1, 2024 at 8:32 PM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached soft copy of invoices.

go happy go hojo
https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1YJEXLTMOMWQtNDIWNCO5ZTAXLWYOQYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6Ot. ..
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6/27/24, 10:38 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099
Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website - www.hojokolkata.com

AHoward Johnson

EY WYNDHAM
KOLEATA

New Town Sguare, Beside spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, kolkata 7001368 INDIA

P! 48133 6655 7000 « F! +91 33 6655 7099
hojokoleata com | info@hojokolkata.com

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

E/ Count on Us™ /| ® WATCH VIDEO

to put safety first

On Sat, Apr 27, 2024 at 6:05 PM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please update our payment date.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. .. 4/12



6/27/24, 10:38 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook
West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099
Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com

AHoward Johuson

EY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Square, Beside Spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700136 INDIA

Pi 48133 6655 7000 » F! +21 33 6655 7099
hojokalkata.com | info@hojokolkata com

HOWARD JOHNSON
ELTEIL T

L=

Count on Us™
to put safety first

(® WATCH VIDEO

On Wed, Apr 17, 2024 at 4:46 PM Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi,

PFA the balance summary.

Also provide following details for vendor update.

GST certificate
PAN
Bank details

CIN (If available)

Regards,

Arun Kanti Patra | Sr. Manager HR | 6292126644

From: Account Receivable ar@hojokolkata.com

Sent: Tuesday, April 9, 2024 9:53 AM

To: Arun Patra arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com

Cc: Ravi Prakash fc@hojokolkata.com; Debarshi Sanyal gm@hojokolkata.com; Ranjit Roy Choudhury hos@hojokolkata.com
Subject: Re: INVOICE SOFT COPY

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. .. 5/12



6/27/24, 10:38 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

Dear Business Partner,

Please find the attached soft copy of the outstanding ledger. Kindly payment is clear ASAP.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099
Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com

AHoward Johnson
BEY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Sguare, Beside spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700126 INDIA

P! 48133 6655 7000 « F. +9] 33 6655 7099
hejokolkata.com | info@hojokolkata.com

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

|| Count on Us (® WATCH VIDEO

to put safety first

On Tue, Apr 2, 2024 at 3:27 PM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached soft copy of invoice.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das
https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQtNDIWNCO5ZTAXLWYQYTM3MzAXOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6eOt. .. 6/12



6/27/24, 10:38 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099
Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com

AHoward Johnson
BY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Square, Beside Spencer Mall, Chinar Park =
Atghara, kKolkata 7001368 INDIA

P +9133 6655 7000 « F. +2133 6655 7099
hojokolkata.com | infoahojokolkata.com

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

Il Count on Us~ /"' (® WATCH VIDEO

to put safety first

On Sat, Jan 27, 2024 at 3:08 PM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached soft copy of the invoice.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. .. 7/12



6/27/24, 10:38 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com

LA
AHoward Johuson
EY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Square, Baside Spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700136 INDIA

P! 48133 6655 7000 « F. +91 336655 7099
hojokalkata.com | info@hojokolkata com

HOWARD JOHNSON
ELTEIL T

L=

|Z’ Count on Us™ /' ®WATcH viDEO

to put safety first

On Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 1:01 PM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached soft copy of invoices.
go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099
Email id . ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com

_,4:@\“_" S
AHoward Jotuson
BY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Square, Beside Spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700136 INDIA

Pi 40133 6655 7000 * F; +21 33 6655 7009
hojokoliata.com | info@hojokolkata com

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. .. 8/12
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HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

|| sornton /' ®WATCH viDEO

to put safety first

On Thu, Oct 19, 2023 at 3:56 PM Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

18-10-2023 06:16:48 18-10-2023 NEFT O/W-YESIG32910005695-UTIB0000026-Platinum World Hospitality Private-0000000000357352 YES

Regards,

Arun Kanti Patra | Sr. Manager HR | 6292126644

From: Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2023 11:35 AM

To: Arun Patra <arun.patra@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ravi Prakash <fc@hojokolkata.com>; Debarshi Sanyal <gm@hojokolkata.com>; Ranjit Roy Choudhury <hos@hojokolkata.com>
Subject: Re: INVOICE SOFT COPY

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know
the content is safe.

Dear Business Partner,

Please find the attached soft copy of invoice.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000

Fax: +91 33 6655 7099

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. .. 9/12



6/27/24, 10:38 AM Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website - www.hojokolkata.com

AHoward Johnson
EY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

-

New Town Square, Beslde Spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700138 INDIA

P 40133 6655 7000 « F +91 33 6655 7099
hojokolatacom | infoahojokolkata.com

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

|| o ren s (® WATCH VIDEO

to put safety first

On Tue, Sep 19, 2023 at 6:16 PM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Business Partner,

Please find the attached soft copy of invoices.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099
Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com

SHoward Johnson
EY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA

New Town Square, Beside Spencer Mall, Chinar Park 5
Atghara, Kolkata 700136 INDIA

P! +@1 33 6655 7000 « F: +91 33 6655 7009
hojokolkata.com | infaahojokolkata.com

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. ..
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6/27/24, 10:38 AM

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. ..

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

Count on Us™
to put safety first

Dear Sir,

Please Find the attached soft copy invoice.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000
Fax: +91 33 6655 7099
Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com

Website : www.hojokolkata.com

JHoward Johnson
BY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA
New Town Sguare, Beside spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700126 INDIA

Pi+0133 6655 7000 = F. +9] 33 6655 7099
hejokolkata.com | info@hojokolkata.com

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

L2

IZ Count on Us™

to put safety first

Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

(® WATCH VIDEO

On Mon, Jun 26, 2023 at 1:58 PM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

(® WATCH VIDEO
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https://outlook.office365.com/mail/id/AAQKAGVhMzE1Y]EXLTMOMWQINDIWNCOSZTAXLWYOYTM3MzAxOTI4AMAAQAGcMand%2BGqVMg6EOt. ..

Mail - Invoices Kolkata - Outlook

On Thu, Jun 22, 2023 at 11:11 AM Account Receivable <ar@hojokolkata.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached soft copy of the invoice.

go happy go hojo

Warm Regards,

Deep Das

Account Receivable Executive

Howard Johnson by Wyndham Kolkata
New Town Square, Beside Spencer's Mall,
Chinar Park, Kolkata - 700136

West Bengal, India.

Landline number : +91 33 6655 7000

Fax: +91 33 6655 7099

Email id : ar@hojokolkata.com
Website : www.hojokolkata.com

AHHoward Johnson

EY WYNDHAM
KOLKATA
New Town Square, Baside Spencer Mall, Chinar Park
Atghara, Kolkata 700138 INDIA

Pi +8133 6655 7000 + F. +31 336655 7089
hojokalkata.com | infomhojokolkatacorm

HOWARD JOHNSON
Bangalore

LS

D\/ Count on Us™

to put safety first

(® WATCH VIDEO
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