HYDROL - B

18T Floor, No 8-B, M

PRt T
8 L L

unicipal Khata No.3/169/8B/34,

Li 0

Survey No34, 6th Main Road, 3rd Phase, Peenya Industrial Area,
Chokkasandra Village, Yeshwanthpur Hobli, Bangalore 560058
GSTIN: 29AA0FH0932J173

Qrigiaal for Buyer

INCOME TAX PAN NO: AAQFH

0932)

Tax Invoice

Invoice No.  |HLL

P/1331

PO No

Invoice Date

30 March 2024

PO Date

State

Quote /Email Ref

KARNATAKA

Details of Shipment

Contact Details

Bangalore Terminal 1 {BLR Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd.)

Contact Person :

Amount In Words

Rupees Forly Seven Thousand nine thundred ninety seven only

Kempegowda International Airport, KIAL Road, Devanahalli, Bengaluru Urban, Karnataka, 560300 Na
N/A
GSTIN NO: 29AAICB4881B1ZM . - ) Contact Number :
State: KARNATAKA Code | 29 N/A
S. ; HSN Amount
Product Description Batch No Report Number uom t Rate
No. : R I <P o Code auy (Rs)
,,i"s.leamvd Rice Terminal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326005 998346( NOS 1 1.175 1,175
,/Z' Dal Makhni Terminal 1 HLB/20723-24/0326006 998346| NOS 1 1.175 1,175
(3’ Butter Chicken Terminal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326007 998346 NOS 1 1,175 1,135
/f?aunush Salad Terminal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326008 998346| NOS 1 1,175 1,175
/,5 Kashmiri Phirni Terminal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326009 998346 NOS 1 LAES: 1,175
}Banana Cake Terminal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326010 998346 NOS ] 1,175 11725
Hand Swab(Mr.Joseph Benitlo Praductions) Termunal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326011 998346] NOS 1 1,675 1,67%
} Hand Swab(Mawi-operations) Terninal 1 1HL.B/2023-24/0326012 998346 NOS 1 1,675 1,675
}’Uni(mm Swab Terniinal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326013 998346 NOS 1 1,675 1,675
}9’ Equipment Swab(Sauce Pan) Ternunal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326014 998346| NOS 1 1,675 1,675
,a{ Equipment Swab(Ladle) Terminal 1 1HLB/2023-24/0326015 998346| NOS 1] 1675 1,675
/ﬁ Equipment Swab{Veg Chopping Board) Terminal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326016 998346| NOS 1 1,675 1,675
,ﬁ Equipment Swab(Non-Veg Chopping Boarc) Terimnal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326017 §98346| NOS 1 1675 1,675
/{4 RO Cooking Water Terminal 1 HLE/2023-24/0326018 998316| NOS 1( 10,950 10,950
/ﬁ RO Drinking Water Terininal 1 HLB/2023-24/0326019 998346( NOS 1] 10,950 10,950
Total 15 40,675
Beneficary Name Hydrolabs Environmental Services LLP Total Amount before Tax 4({615
Bank Name Kotak Mahindra ) Add: CGST@9% 3861
Account Number '17452895965 ) Add:SGST@ 9% B » 3,661
IFsc KKBK0000422 fotal TaxAmount | 7372
Account Type Current Account
Total Amount after Tax: 47,997

Terms and Conditions:

1 Cheque shouid Be in favor of Hydrolabs Environmer

7 Bayment Termis with in 1 weed

2 il not paid in due e subject

4.0ut responsibifity ceases once goors ave our o

1o interest a1 24

e Jurke disction Only

For Hydrolabs Environmental Services LLP

Authorised signatory

5 All Disputes Subjact Ta Bangalo

I5t Floor, Ko B-B, Municipal Khatha No 3/ 169/80/34,

eenya Industrial Area,

angalore 560058
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Re: Invoice_Hydrolabs

Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>
Wed 26-Jun-24 7:32 PM

To:Bangalore QA <blrlounge.qa@blrlounge.in>
Cc:Prathap R <prathap.r@k-corp.in>;Ravi Kumar <ravikumar@k-corp.in>;Bangalore Stores
<bangalore.store@blrlounge.in>;Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Hi Alida,

Please proceed.
Thanks

Kind Regards

Rohan Choudhury
General Manager

BLR Lounge Services Pvt Ltd

Room # 20 1st Floor Alpha 3 Building,
Kempegowda International Airport, KIAL Road,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, Karanataka 560300.
M: 9707181219
www.travelfoodservices.com

On 26 Jun 2024, at 18:13, Bangalore QA <blrlounge.qa@blrlounge.in> wrote:

Dear Rohan Sir,

Would kindly request your approval to process the payment for the food, swab and
water test done for BLR Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd. in the month of March 2024. Attached

is the invoice for your reference.

Thanks and regards,

Alida Tina Peres

QA-BLRTL

BLR Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd.
Room #20 1st Floor Alpha 3 Builc
srional Airport

Kempegowda Inter
Devanahalli, Bengalury, Karnataka &
wyww. travelfoodservices.com

<Qutlook-hy05vhfz.png>
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