Globol inc.

medla solutions

Provisional GSTIN 29AFTPA1788B1ZB
Hand Phone : +91-9901444776

Invoice

To,
m/s. BLRLOUNGE SERVICESPvt. Ltd. e

Kempegowda International Airport, Kial Rd, Devanahalli,

.......................................................................................

.......................................................................................

Customer State Code : 29

-------------------------------------------------------

............................

Customer GSTIN : 29AABCB8973D12G

SL.NO. DESCRIPTION

HSN CODE

SqFt

Qty In No’s

Rate Per No’s / Sq Ft. AMOUNT(Rs.)

1 | T1080 EAST - Directional tactical creative
High-resolution digital print on 3M vinyl with lamination
396 Sq ft

sl
170 .

| 350

391990

1

49,50(5.00 49,500.00

Basic Amount 49,500.00
SGST9% 4,455.00
CGST 9% 4,455.00
Total Amount 58,410.00

GRAND TOTAL 58,410.00

(Rupees Fifty Eight Thousand Four Hundred And Ten Only)
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# 37/1, 2nd Main Road, Seshadripuram, Bangalore-560 020-
E-mail : globalinc.blr@gmail.com
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ILRPO24-25000080 - Global Inc

i Hand Phone: +91 65014 44776] E-Mail: globaling.bir@gmail.com |
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Sweta Pugalia

To: Bangalore Stores: Snehal Jadhav
Ce: Rajeev T; Prathap R <PRATHAP.R@K-CORP.IN>; Chetan Bobade; +2 others

Hi Ravi,
Kindly process the GRN.

@Snehal Jadhav Kindly assistin processing the payment for the same.

Regards
Sweta Pugalia
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BLRPO24-25000080 - Global Inc

Rohan Choudhury 8 & %
To: Sweta Pugalia
Cc: Rajeav T; Prathap R <PRATHAP R@K-CORP.IN>: Bangalore Stores; +2 others

Dear Sweta,
Please proceed.
Thanks

Kind Regards

Rohan Choudhury
General Manager

BLR Lounge Services Pvt Ltd
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Fri 6/28/2024 10:06 A
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LRPO24-25000080 - Global Inc

Devanahalli, Berigéiur-ur Karanataka 560300.
M: 9707181219
www.travelfoodservices.com

On 28 Jun 2024, at 08:56, Sweta Pugalia <sweta.pugalia@blriounge.in> wrote:

Dear Rohan Sir,

Please approve the execution performed at the airport premises by Global Media Solution.

This will help us process the GRN for the shared invoice.

Regards
Sweta Pugalia
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