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M G ma il SHIKHA TARAFDAR <dishaserviceprovider@gmail.com>

OLD & NEW TRADE LICENSE QUATATION FOR NSCBI AIRPORT,KOLKATA

3 messages

SHIKHA TARAFDAR <dishaserviceprovider@gmail.com> 9 September 2024 at 17:17
To: prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com
Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>, kolkata.admin@travelfoodservices.com

Respected Sir,
As per discussion with Mr.Gourab Bhattacharjya (Sr.Admin Executive)with me regarding old(Existing) outlet & New
outlet trade license processing fees here at North Dum Dum Municipality,Birati, Notth 24 Parganas, West Bengal is

given below for your reference & kind Cansideration Sir .

TRADE LICENSE 24-25

Old(Existing) Outlet New Outlet

Annual Processing Fees every time

| Approx Rs 1500/ per OfL| Approx Rs 1500/ per O/L
for Process & issuance of TL

s - SRS Rs 4000/ per OfL N.A Miscellaneous Charge for TL

P St IR o MR One tirme payment in new outlet case
Municipality Development Fees N.A Rs 8000/ per OfL pay for L

T e (S g T i S \

Bank Details :-

Bank Name:- UNION BANK OF INDIA
Alc Name:- Disha Service Provider
Al/c Type:- Current

Alc No :-684201010050263

IFSC Code :- UBIND568422

Thanks & Regards,
Disha Service Provider
Sikha Tarafdar

Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com> 10 September 2024 at 13:44

To: SHIKHA TARAFDAR <dishaserviceprovider@gmail.com>
Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>, Kolkata Admin <kolkata.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Noted Thanks

From: SHIKHA TARAFDAR <dishaserviceprovider@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 5:17 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawani@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Kolkata Admin <kolkata.admin@

traveifoodservices.com>
Subject: OLD & NEW TRADE LICENSE QUATATION FOR NSCBI AIRPORT,KOLKATA
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cognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Respected Sir,

As per discussion with Mr.Gourab Bhattacharjya (Sr.Admin Executive)with me regarding old(Existing) outlet & New
outlet trade license processing fees here at North Dum Dum Municipality,Birati, North 24 Parganas, West Bengal is

given below for your reference & kind Consideration Sir .

Old(Existing) Outiet New Outlet

| Approx Rs 1500/ per O/L| Approx Rs 1500/ per O/L

Annual Processing Fees every time

for Process & issuance of TL

T T

oy SREONSENARES |  Rs 4000/ per O/L N.A Miscellaneous Charge for TL

= : AL =] One time payment in naw outlet case
= N.A Rs 8000/ per O/L B PR

iy S e S MRS for TL

Bank Details :- 3

Bank Name:- UNION BANK OF INDIA
A/c Name:- Disha Service Provider
A/c Type:- Current

A/c No :- 684201010050263

IFSC Code :- UBIN0568422

Thanks & Regards,
Disha Service Provider

Sikha Tarafdar

Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>
To: SHIKHA TARAFDAR <dishaserviceprovider@gmail.com>

10 September 2024 at 15:52

Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>, Kolkata Admin <kolkata.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Sikha,

Please send me the Shops and Establishment and Trade License renewal fees and professional charges and for
new License fees and professional charges. Advise please can we transfer existing Licenses to the other company

name and also share the charges for the same.

Please share your mobile number.
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[ &

Regards

Prabhakar

Mob 8879660006

From: SHIKHA TARAFDAR <dishaserviceprovider@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 5:17 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Kolkata Admin <kolkata.admin@
traveifoodservices.com>

Subject: OLD & NEW TRADE LICENSE QUATATION FOR NSCBI AIRPORT,KOLKATA

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments uniess you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Respected Sir,

As per discussion with Mr.Gourab Bhattacharjya (Sr.Admin Executive)with me regarding old(Existing) outlet & New
outlet trade license processing fees here at North Dum Dum Municipality,Birati, North 24 Parganas, West Bengal is
given below for your reference & kind Consideration Sir .

TRADE LICENSE 24-25

Old{Existing) Outlet New Outlet

Annual Processing Fees every time

| Approx Rs 1500/ per OfL| Approx Rs 1500/ per O/L
- for Process & issuance of TL

Rs 4000/ per O/L LA Miscellaneous Charge for TL
One time payment in new outlet case
NA Rs 8000/ per O/L Ray pios

Bank Details :-
Bank Name:- UNION BANK OF INDIA

Alc Name:- Disha Service Provider
AJc Type:- Current

Alc No :- 684201010050263

[FSC Code :- UBIN0568422

Thanks & Regards,




