


SNo Item Code
HSN\SAC 

Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise
Total Tax 

Amount(ININR)
Total Amount

(ININR)
1 7000038 8418 REFRIGERATOR 2 Door Vertical Freezer 

RC2D700GC-BLUE STAR
NOS 68,000.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 68000.00

2 7000038 8418 REFRIGERATOR 2 Door Vertical Chiller 
RC2D700GCM - BLUE STAR

NOS 60,000.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 60000.00

Total Unit 2.00
Payment terms - 100% Advance along with the gst amount  Lead time - 7 to 10 days from advance payment  Waranty Type  1 
year warranty Packaging & Freight on actuals Outlet - Ahmedabad Store location 

Total Taxable INR 1,28,000.00

Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 23,040.00

a) Products to be Supplied by 
Supplier at own cost

b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00

c) Delivery schedule to be 
taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 
DELIVERY ADDRESS.

0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will 
be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or 
the GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 1,51,040.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority.  If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at 
the earliest.  Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.

Page No: 1

Vendor No. V000376
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001408

Page No: 111-10-2023  12:33:18
Blue Star Limited9A, Blue Star House, Ghatkopar Link RoadSakinaka, Andheri EastMUMBAI, 400072India

Shipped Location
AHM Dry Store WorksT2, AHM Int. Airport LTD, Hansol, Ahmedabad, GujaratAHMEDABAD, 382475IndiaIndia

Invoice LocationAHM Dry Store WorksT2, AHM Int. Airport LTD, Hansol, Ahmedabad, Gujarat382475IndiaIN

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate, Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AAACB4487D Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 11-10-2023

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27ABICS8699F1ZJ

24ABICS8699F1ZPGSTIN No.

State 27

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AAACB4487D1ZSVendor Inv. No.
Vendor Phone No. 9820977531/9168701011
Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email crdnad_support@bluestarindia.com

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type
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Vendor No. V000376
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001408

Page No: 211-10-2023  12:33:19
Blue Star Limited9A, Blue Star House, Ghatkopar Link RoadSakinaka, Andheri EastMUMBAI, 400072India

Shipped Location
AHM Dry Store WorksT2, AHM Int. Airport LTD, Hansol, Ahmedabad, GujaratAHMEDABAD, 382475IndiaIndia

Invoice LocationAHM Dry Store WorksT2, AHM Int. Airport LTD, Hansol, Ahmedabad, Gujarat382475IndiaIN

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate, Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AAACB4487D Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 11-10-2023

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27ABICS8699F1ZJ

24ABICS8699F1ZPGSTIN No.

State 27

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AAACB4487D1ZSVendor Inv. No.
Vendor Phone No. 9820977531/9168701011
Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email crdnad_support@bluestarindia.com

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type
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Abdul Rehman

From: Abdul Rehman
Sent: 11 October 2023 12:04
To: Abhijeet Saxena
Cc: Jatin Jain; Akshay Sharma; Ameet Koomar; Santosh Tambe; 'Nalin Jaswal'
Subject: RE: Chiller & Freezer for AMD airport

Hi Abhijeet,  
 
Can you please let us know which Store code to be used for raising PO.  
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Abdul Rehman 
📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
 

From: Nalin Jaswal <Nalin.Jaswal@adani.com>  
Sent: 09 October 2023 15:11 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Abhijeet Saxena <abhijeet.saxena@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet 
Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Chiller & Freezer for AMD airport 
 
OK Please Process  
 

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>  
Sent: Friday, September 29, 2023 6:19 PM 
To: Nalin Jaswal <Nalin.Jaswal@adani.com> 
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; akshay.sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Abhijeet Saxena <abhijeet.saxena@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet 
Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Chiller & Freezer for AMD airport 
 
*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 
 
Hi Nalin, 
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We currently have an Agreement with Bluestar, which allows us to acquire the same material at a lower cost. Please find the details below and our Rate Contract is 
aƩached for your reference. 
 
We kindly request your guidance on whether we should proceed with Bluestar or Elan Pro. 
 

Material Description   Dimesion QTY MRIPL ELAN Bluestar 
2 DOOR VERTICAL FREEZER WITH LOCKABLE CASTOR 
WHEELS (2 Nos.WITH BREAK INFRONT & 2 Nos. 
WITHOUT BREAK)  & HEATING ELEMENT FOR DRAIN 

RC2D700GC-
BLUE STAR 

700 x 880 x 
2030 1          65,000             65,000           71,088             71,088           68,000  

2 DOOR VERTICAL CHILLER  WITH LOCKABLE CASTOR 
WHEELS (2 Nos.WITH BREAK INFRONT & 2 Nos. 
WITHOUT BREAK)  & HEATING ELEMENT FOR DRAIN 

RC2D700GCM - 
BLUE STAR 

700 x 880 x 
2030 1          78,500             78,500           81,932             81,932           60,000  

Freight Charges                    20,000        
Total Basic Price                1,63,500           1,53,020       1,28,000  
GST @18%                    29,430               27,544           23,040  
Amount Incl GST                 1,92,930           1,80,564       1,51,040  

 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Abdul Rehman 
📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
 

From: Nalin Jaswal <Nalin.Jaswal@adani.com>  
Sent: 01 September 2023 15:50 
To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com> 
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com> 
Subject: Chiller & Freezer for AMD airport 
 
Dear Santosh Ji, 
 
Please find the attached comparison for Chiller & Freezer for AMD airport 
Please process accordingly 
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M/s ELAN is L1 
 
 Payment : 100% advance along with the PO. 
 As per verbal confirmation from M/s Elan the material is available with them @ Chennai Location 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Nalin Jaswal 
   
Techno-Commercial 
Adani Airport Holding Ltd. 
Commercial House 6 Corporate Road, Off SG Highway  
Prahaldnagar, Ahmedabad. 
Mo. +91 6358941460 
 
 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is 
confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this 
e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views 
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
 
WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any 
damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  






