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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ranjandas S
Sent: 12 June 2024 13:06
To: Shama Nair
Cc: Shama Nair; Shadab Sukri; Nimisha Jadhav; Suraj Kumbhar
Subject: FW: T1 BLR LOUNGE BARRICATION WORK FINAL BILL
Attachments: 10 Tax Invoice ( Barrication Work BLR Lounge )  Shah Enterprises Mumbai.pdf; PO 30 final bill.xlsx

Dear Shama, 
 
Please find attached herewith the certified copy of Barricade work final bill.  There is Rs.7.33lakhs saving. 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
 

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 11:56 AM 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: T1 BLR LOUNGE BARRICATION WORK FINAL BILL 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear All, 
 
I have attached the final Tax Invoice for Barrication Work BLR Lounge so please check & process the payment  
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Thanks & Regards 
Modassir Wasim 

 
On Wed, Jun 12, 2024 at 10:45 AM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> wrote: 

Dear Sabir, 

  

Please find attached herewith the final bill of lounge barricade PO no.30 for your acceptance. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 

  

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2024 5:08 PM 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Subject: Re: T1 BLR LOUNGE BARRICATION WORK FINAL BILL 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
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Dear Sir, 

I apologise for the mistake done by us. Request you to Please check and verify for this time. 

  

Thanks & Regards 
 Shah Enterprises  

  

  

On Tue, Jun 11, 2024 at 5:00 PM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> wrote: 

Totally not acceptable. We certified Rs.22,41,575 with GST in RA 1 but you are deducted only Rs.18,99640. Please check your GST invoice. Also give the proper 
measurement of mesh. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 

  

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2024 4:49 PM 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Subject: Re: T1 BLR LOUNGE BARRICATION WORK FINAL BILL 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Sir, 

Please find the Final Bill with measurement sheet. 

  

Thanks & Regards 
 Shah Enterprises 

  

On Tue, Jun 11, 2024 at 4:13 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

Please find the measurement as requested. 

  

Thanks & Regards 
 Shah Enterprises 

  

On Tue, Jun 11, 2024 at 3:21 PM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> wrote: 

Barricade work measurements not there for item no. 1 & 3 . please share the same. 
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Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 

  

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, June 1, 2024 9:03 AM 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Subject: T1 BLR LOUNGE BARRICATION WORK FINAL BILL 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Sir, 

Please find the attachment of T1 BLR Lounge Barrication work final bill.  

So, requesting for Verifying and please confirm that we can Provide the Tax Invoices. 

  

Thanks & Regards 
 Shah Enterprises 


