Tax Invoice

7 H + : i
Business Business Pluss Network Private Limited Invoice No. Dated
CIN U70100HR2020PTC084863 BP/2024-25/V149 16-Oct-24
202, Second Floor, EF3 Mall, S
Sector 20A, Mathura Road, Delivery Note Mode/Terms of Payment
Faridabad- 121001, Haryana
Additional Address : Vatika Mindscapes
;il: d’:‘g‘;’a 'T;’:‘:;’f(')’&a- Mathura Road Reference No. & Date. Other References
GSTIN/UIN: 06AAICB8705C1ZX
State Name : Haryana, Code : 06 B ar's Order ND Dated
Buyer (Bill to) - :
TFS GURGAON AIRPORT SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED Dispatch Doc No. Delivery Note Date
12th Floor, Vatika Minscapes, Tower-A, Mathura Road
Sector 27D, Faridabad Dispatched through Destination
GSTIN/UIN : 06AAKCT9336M1ZN
State Name : Haryana, Code : 06 Terms of Delivery
Place of Supply : Haryana
Sl Particulars HSN/SAC Amount
No.
1 Annual Subcription Charges 9995 40,000.00
Output Cgst 3,600.00
Output Sgst 3,600.00
Total ¥ 47,200.00
Amount Chargeable (in words) E.&OE
INR Forty Seven Thousand Two Hundred Only
HSN/SAC Taxable CGST SGST/UTGST Total
Value Rate Amount Rate Amount Tax Amount
9995 40,000.00 9% 3,600.00 9% 3,600.00 7,200.00
Total 40,000.00 3,600.00 3,600.00 7,200.00

Tax Amount (in words) :

Declaration
Payment should be done within 7 days of invoice
date. After that an interst @ 2.5% pm will be charged

INR Seven Thousand Two Hundred Only

Company’s Bank Details

Bank Name : ICICI Bank Limited
Alc No. . 102505502784
Branch & IFS Code : ICIC0001025

for Business Pluss Network Private Limited

| Authorised Signatory

This is a Computer Generated Invoice




T TTmeSEM neyiseed UCe Tor |FS entity - Surendra Singh - Outiook
To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>
Cc: Ravindra Kumar Aaszaa.rcam_.®qm<m:oo%m2mnmm.no:..v,. Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoods rvices.com>; manmeet.bakshi

<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.co >; Surendra Singh Aam__‘__.d.mﬂoqmm:_.me.m:ooammgnmm. om>; Rakesh Kumar Singh <delhiT1.purchas
Subject: Proposed Registered Office for TES entity

Dear Safal Support Team,
Please give access to below users for TFS Gurgaon in safal urgently.

User Name: GAURAV.JOSHI(TFSPLT1 Delhi)

User Name: RAVINDRA KUMAR(TFSPLT1 Delhi)

User Name: SURENDRA SINGH(TFSPLT1 Delhi) .
User Name: RAKESH.KUMAR(TFSPLT1 Delhi)

Regards,
Gaurav Joshi

From: Parag Pandey AEmanmzams@z.me,m_*oonmm_.snmm.noav
Sent: 02 December 2024 13:16

To: Gaurav Joshi nmm:_.m<._.om:m@c.m,gm:ooamm_,snmm.no:._v.. Ravindra Kumar <ravindra.kumar travelfoodservices.com>; Surendra Singh
—————tlVICes.com>; 5

<delhiT1.store travelfoodservices.com>

geihil L.store@travelfoodservices.com:

Cc: Rituparn Sharma Amﬂlctmﬁz.mrm_.3m®ﬁa<m:oo%m2_nmm. . i .Si I@.:.mc.m:ooamm:..ﬁmm.noav.. Udayan Gupta
Acgmﬁ:.mmnﬁm@#qm<m:ooammqsnmm.83v.. Invoices TFS <invoices travelfoodservi anmeet Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi travelfoodservices.com>; Maya
udayan. -Lraveltoodservices.com “Lraveitoodservices.com

Rajguru <maya.rajguru@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Proposed Registered Office for TFS entity -

Hello Gaurav/ Ravindra,

With reference to my discussion with Manmeet please find attached invoice of office rent (virtual office) for TFS GURGAON AIRPORT SERVICES PRIVATE
LIMITED which needs to submit in SAFAL so that Manmeet can approve the same to process for payment. .

If you guys don’t have access for TFS Gurgaon in SAFAL, please put email to Support team and get the access ASAP. Treat this urgent this time as m_qm..m%
delayed and may attract interest if we make late payment.

Confirm once done.

Regards,
Parag Pandey

From: Pratap Singh <Rratap.singh@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 29 November 2024 11:22
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