Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 28 May 2024 06:23

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Jagadish H T; binu.balachandran; Ajit Singh; Shama Nair

Subject: RE: Invoice for design works of Budweiser bar, Dilli streat and Teco bell

Dear Nimisha,
Please process payment

Regards
Shadab Sukri

From: Jagadish H T <htjagadish@gmail.com>

Sent: 27 May 2024 09:05 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit
Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Invoice for design works of Budweiser bar, Dilli streat and Teco bell

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Shadab,

We have completed the design and detailing for the following structures for DIAL T1 project and the erection of these structures have also been completed at
site.

1) Budweiser Bar

2) Dilli streat

3) Taco Bell

Regarding Budweiser Bar, we had earlier submitted an invoice for 95% payment and the same was received by us. Now as the structure erection is completed,
we are hereby raising the balance 5% against invoice no. BSD/006/2024-25



Regarding Dilli streat and Taco Bell, as the work at site is completed, we are hereby raising 100% bill against invoice no. BSD/007/2024-25 for Dilli streat and
BSD/008/2024-25 for Taco Bell.

The total of all three invoices is Rs 50,822/- including GST and after deduction of TDS. All the three invoices are attached.
May please release the payment at the earliest.
Regards

H T JAGADISH
BSD STRUCTURAL CONSULTANTS



