Asad Shamsi

From: Shwetank Sharma

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 1:31 PM

To: Rakesh Singh Rathore; Asad Shamsi

Cc: Praful Surve; Akshay Sharma; Venu Madhav Singaraju

Subject: RE: Renewal of 0365 "Apps for Business" Licenses - Semolina Jaipur

OK. Approved..

Regards,

Shwetank Sharma

DGM - Operations

Semolina Kitchens Pvt Ltd, Jaipur
Contact - 9953099039

From: Rakesh Singh Rathore <rakesh.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: 17 December 2024 13:15

To: Shwetank Sharma <shwetank.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Praful Surve <praful.surve@travelfoodservices.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Renewal of 0365 "Apps for Business" Licenses - Semolina Jaipur

Dear Sir

Currently we are using 13 systems and 2 backups.
So please approve total 15 licenses.

Regards

Rakesh Singh Rathore



7222073333

From: Shwetank Sharma <shwetank.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2024 8:20:11 PM

To: Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rakesh Singh Rathore <rakesh.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Praful Surve <praful.surve@travelfoodservices.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Renewal of 0365 "Apps for Business" Licenses - Semolina Jaipur

Dear Rakesh,

Kindly check as | don’t see 23 systems working with us.
Kindly confirm and then accordingly | will approve.

Regards,

Shwetank Sharma

DGM - Operations

Semolina Kitchens Pvt Ltd, Jaipur
Contact - 9953099039

From: Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 16 December 2024 18:05

To: Shwetank Sharma <shwetank.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Rakesh Singh Rathore <rakesh.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Praful Surve <praful.surve@travelfoodservices.com>; Akshay Sharma
<akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Renewal of 0365 "Apps for Business" Licenses - Semolina Jaipur

Importance: High

Dear Ravindra,

Please note that our Microsoft 365 “Apps for Business” existing licenses renewal is due on 21° December 2024.
This SKU was procured with our old Microsoft Partner in the mid-term and now it has to be renewed with our current partner upon expiry on pro-rate
basis.

Attached is the Pl against the same and summary below.
Request for your approval to get the same procured ASAP.



License Details:-

Sr. No. | Plan Name Pro-Rate Quantity Total

1 Apps for Business 2,900.50 23 66,711.50
Regards
Asad Shamsi

+91 9930909463




