Trupti Dalvi

From: Sumit Kumar

Sent: 19 May 2024 11:13

To: Trupti Dalvi

Cc: Irfan Sayed; Ravindra Kumar Singh; Antim Sharma; Divesh Tripathi
Subject: RE: Invoice Approval - Riddhi Corporation - LKO

YES, It’s Received.

From: Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Saturday, May 18, 2024 1:26 PM

To: Sumit Kumar <sumit.kumar@semolinakitchens.com>; Ravindra Kumar Singh <ravindra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; Divesh Tripathi
<divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Antim Sharma <antim.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>
Cc: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Invoice Approval - Riddhi Corporation - LKO

Dear Sumit,

Kindly check and certified attached Invoice of Riddhi Corporate Services Limited.

V000430 Riddhi Corporate Services Limited

Payment

YES

ADV/23-24/000760

50%SEMOLINA/PO/23-24/000411

Dear Irfan Sir,
Kindly approve the same to upload invoice on safal.
Thanks & Regards,

Trupti Dalvi
Project Coordinator




