Trupti Dalvi

From: Sitaram Mistry

Sent: 12 July 2024 13:27

To: Trupti Dalvi; Abdul Rehman; Abdul Rehman
Cc: Santosh Tambe; Ajit Singh

Subject: FW: The Oven

Attachments: The Oven.pdf

Dear Abdul/ Trupti,

Please find the attached Invoice for the Merrychef equipment.

Thanks & Regards,
Sitaram Mistry

From: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: 12 July 2024 11:29

To: Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: The Oven

PFA



