Samrat Narvekar

From: Samrat Narvekar

Sent: 14 June 2024 13:06

To: Nikhil Bhushan

Subject: FW: Tax invoice & Manpower invoice
Attachments: SR-027.pdf

Dear Nikhil,

Kindly approve the Manpower charges for May 2024.
Regards

Samrat

From: kamlesh gupta <kgtechnosystems.acc@gmail.com>

Sent: 03 June 2024 17:00

To: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Tax invoice & Manpower invoice

You don't often get email from kgtechnosystems.acc@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Respected sir

Please find attached copy of tax invoice & Manpower invoice.

Thanks & Regards

KC Technosystems LLP
Dipti Shetye

Accountant

Ph no.: 022-24327602
Ph no.: 022-35700546

KG TECHNOSYSTEMS LLP
202,B-wing,Gandhar Tower

Near sayaman House, Sayani Rd,
Mumbai, 400025.

www.kgtechnosystems.com




