Samrat Narvekar

From: Nikhil Bhushan

Sent: 08 August 2024 16:24
To: Samrat Narvekar
Subject: Re: tax invoice manpower
Approved

Regards,

Nikhil
9820171661

Get Outlook for Android

From: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2024 3:36:44 PM

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: tax invoice manpower

Dear Nikhil,
Pls approve Manpower charges for July2024.
Regards,

Samratr

From: kamlesh gupta <kgtechnosystems.acc@gmail.com>

Sent: 03 August 2024 17:28

To: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: tax invoice manpower

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Respected sir

Please find attached copy of tax invvoice

Thanks & Regards

KC Technosystems LLP
Dipti Shetye

Accountant

Ph no.: 022-24327602
Ph no.: 022-35700546
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