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TFS Legal

From: Pankaj Rathi
Sent: 31 May 2024 14:21
To: TFS Legal
Cc: Nidhi Goradia; Deepak Kurian
Subject: RE: Approval for BSR & Co.LLP Invoice  

Approved from my side. 
 
B/Rgds 
Pankaj 
 

From: TFS Legal <mumbai.legal@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 2:16 PM 
To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Nidhi Goradia <nidhi.goradia@travelfoodservices.com>; Deepak Kurian <deepak.kurian@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Approval for BSR & Co.LLP Invoice  
 
Dear Sir, 
 

Kindly approve the attached invoice. 
 

Thanks & Regards  
Fardin Shaikh  
Legal Assistant  
 


