Lounge IT

From: Nikhil Bhushan

Sent: Friday, May 3, 2024 7:53 PM

To: Lounge IT

Cc: Samrat Narvekar

Subject: Re: Primenet ILL Invoice- Quarterly (MALS T2)
Approved

Regards,

Nikhil

9820171661

Get Qutlook for Android

From: Lounge IT <lounge.it@mumbailounge.in>

Sent: Friday, May 3, 2024 12:06:51 PM

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Primenet ILL Invoice- Quarterly (MALS T2)

Dear Nikhil Sir,
Kindly approve the quarterly (01-04-2024 To 30-06-2024) Internet Lease Line Bandwidth charges for MALS T2.

Invoice No. — MG24Y-00355
Amount -44,250/-

Thanks & Regards

Nitesh Kumar

IT - Executive

Mumbai Airport Lounge Services
Mob No: +91 9869174506 / 9821919172
Email Id: lounge.it@mumbailounge.in

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
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