Arijit Bera

From: Mona Agarwal

Sent: Wednesday, October 9, 2024 12:16 PM

To: Arijit Bera

Subject: FW: Invoice for registration and consultancy
Attachments: TFS Bill Howrah.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Check TFSPL Kolkata GSTIN and process payment.

From: Lokesh Bothra <lokesh.bothra@rdaga.com>

Sent: 09 October 2024 11:58 AM

To: Mona Agarwal <mona.agarwal@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Invoice for registration and consultancy

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mam,

Please find attached invoice for processing.

Regards,

Lokesh Bothra

CA, CS, IBBI Register Valuer in SFA

R Daga & Company (Chartered Accountants)
Suite No 815A

Diamond Heritage

16 Strand Road Kolkata-700001
Mob:9681462152

Mob:9831505571



