TFS Legal

From: Pankaj Rathi

Sent: 08 July 2024 13:06

To: TFS Legal

Cc: Nidhi Goradia

Subject: RE: Approval for BSR & Co.LLP Invoice

Hi Fardin, Yes ok with me.

B/Rgds
Pankaj

From: TFS Legal <mumbai.legal@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, July 8, 2024 12:49 PM

To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Approval for BSR & Co.LLP Invoice

Dear Sir,

Kindly approve the attached invoice.

Thanks & Regards
Fardin Shaikh
Legal Assistant



