
SNo Item Code
HSN\SAC 

Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise
Total Tax 

Amount(ININR)
Total Amount

(ININR)
1 7000035 8516799 Coffee Machine Ditting 807 Grinder Beverages 

Equipment
EACH 289,000.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 289000.00

Total Unit 1.00

Payments :100 % Advance. Warantee : 1 Year from the date of Invoice  Outlet Name : THE COFFEE BEAN & TEA LEAF 23sqm  
INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT @ T2, B

Total Taxable INR 289,000.00

Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 52,020.00

a) Products to be Supplied by 
Supplier at own cost

b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00

c) Delivery schedule to be 
taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 
DELIVERY ADDRESS.

0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will 
be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or 
the GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 341,020.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority.  If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at 
the earliest.  Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.

Page No: 1

Vendor No. V0000371
Purchase Order

Order Number BLR/PO/22-23/000011

Page No: 17/1/2022  5:08:54 PM

Kaapi Machines India P.Ltd ( OMS )Opp. Star Plus Office, Andheri Kurla RoadMUMBAI, India  400069India

Shipped Location
BLR F&B AirportFOOD & BEVERAGES OUTLETS,BLR F&B AirportKARNATAKA, India  560300India

Invoice LocationBLR F&B AirportFOOD & BEVERAGES OUTLETS,BLR F&B Airport560300IndiaIN

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITEDBlock-A South Wing 1st Floor Shiv Sagar EstateDr. Annie Besant Road, Worli MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AACCK9538Q Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.com mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry Date

Payment Terms
6/28/2022Net 30 Days

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27AADCB2762L1ZI29AADCB2762L1ZEGSTIN No.
State 27

State Code 27State Name MaharashtraVendor GST No. 27AACCK9538Q1ZOVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email

Requisition No.



Page No: 2

Vendor No. V0000371
Purchase Order

Order Number BLR/PO/22-23/000011

Page No: 27/1/2022  5:08:54 PM

Kaapi Machines India P.Ltd ( OMS )Opp. Star Plus Office, Andheri Kurla RoadMUMBAI, India  400069India

Shipped Location
BLR F&B AirportFOOD & BEVERAGES OUTLETS,BLR F&B AirportKARNATAKA, India  560300India

Invoice LocationBLR F&B AirportFOOD & BEVERAGES OUTLETS,BLR F&B Airport560300IndiaIN

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITEDBlock-A South Wing 1st Floor Shiv Sagar EstateDr. Annie Besant Road, Worli MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AACCK9538Q Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.com mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry Date

Payment Terms
6/28/2022Net 30 Days

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27AADCB2762L1ZI29AADCB2762L1ZEGSTIN No.
State 27

State Code 27State Name MaharashtraVendor GST No. 27AACCK9538Q1ZOVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email

Requisition No.
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Sandeep Bhat

From: Amiya Shankar <amiya.shankar@kaapimachines.com>
Sent: Monday, April 18, 2022 4:29 PM
To: Sandeep Bhat
Cc: Salman Khan; Shweta Viras; Gaurav Raj
Subject: RE: Vitamix and Ditting KR 804 for TFS

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Hi Sandeep, 
 
Ditting 804 is discontinued.  
We shall do Ditting 807 . Lead time : End of September if order is placed within April 2022.  
 
Price :  2.89 Lakhs + GST 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 

Amiya Shankar | National Key Account Manager I Kaapi Machines India Pvt Ltd. 

+91-9212028766 

 

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 18 April 2022 14:07 
To: Amiya Shankar <amiya.shankar@kaapimachines.com> 
Cc: Salman Khan <salman.khan@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Vitamix and Ditting KR 804 for TFS 
 
Dear Amiya , 
 
We have urgent requirement for Ditting Grinder. Model No. KR 804 , Kindly quote & revert with lead time  
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Thanks & Regards  
Sandeep Bhat  
Senior Manager Purchase  
Travel foods Services Pvt Ltd 
Shivsagar Estate A-Block , 1st floor 
Dr A.B Road , Worli Mumbai -400018 
Mob : 9821945599  
 
 
 
 

From: Amiya Shankar [mailto:amiya.shankar@kaapimachines.com]  
Sent: Monday, January 31, 2022 3:50 PM 
To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Vitamix and Ditting KR 804 for TFS 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Hi Sandeep, 
As discussed, the rates are as following: 
 
Vitamix- The Quite One Blender @ 1,10,000/- plus GST – immediately available 
Ditting KR-807 @ 2,46,000/- plus GST- Lead times- October 2022 if order is placed by February.  
 
 

Thanks & Regards, 

Amiya Shankar | National Key Account Manager I  

KAAPI MACHINES (INDIA) PRIVATE LIMITED. 

Mobile: +91- 9212028766 

 
Disclaimer and Confidentiality Note: 
********************************************************************************************************************************
********************************************** This electronic message contains information, which is proprietary, confidential and may be legally 
privileged. This electronic message is only for the exclusive use of the intended recipient. Any review, copying, re-transmission, dissemination, use or 
disclosure by anybody other than the intended recipient is unlawful and strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient or the employee or agent 
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responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, please notify us immediately by return mail or telephone and delete/destroy all copies of the original message 
including attachments from your system. This email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, 
lost, destroyed or contain viruses. You are therefore advised to carry out your own virus checks before opening the e-mail or attachments. Our Company 
accepts no liability for errors or omissions in the contents of this message or damage caused by viruses as a result of this e-mail transmission. 
********************************************************************************************************************************
**********************************************  
Disclaimer: This E-Mail (including any attachments) may contain Confidential and/or legally privileged Information and is meant for the intended recipient(s) only. If you 
have received this e-mail in error and are not the intended recipient/s, kindly delete this e-mail immediately from your system. You are also hereby notified that any use, 
any form of reproduction, dissemination, copying, disclosure, modification, distribution and/or publication of this e-mail, its contents or its attachment/s other than by its 
intended recipient/s is strictly prohibited and may be construed unlawful. Internet Communications cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could 
be delayed, intercepted, corrupted, lost, or may contain viruses. Travel Food Services Private Limited does not accept any liability for any errors, omissions, viruses or 
computer shutdown (s) or any kind of disruption/denial of services if any experienced by any recipient as a result of this e-mail. Disclaimer and Confidentiality Note: 
********************************************************************************************************************************************
********************************** This electronic message contains information, which is proprietary, confidential and may be legally privileged. This electronic 
message is only for the exclusive use of the intended recipient. Any review, copying, re-transmission, dissemination, use or disclosure by anybody other than the intended 
recipient is unlawful and strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient or the employee or agent responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, please notify 
us immediately by return mail or telephone and delete/destroy all copies of the original message including attachments from your system. This email transmission cannot 
be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed or contain viruses. You are therefore advised to carry out your own 
virus checks before opening the e-mail or attachments. Our Company accepts no liability for errors or omissions in the contents of this message or damage caused by 
viruses as a result of this e-mail transmission. 
********************************************************************************************************************************************
**********************************  
Disclaimer and Confidentiality Note: 
********************************************************************************************************************************
********************************************** This electronic message contains information, which is proprietary, confidential and may be legally 
privileged. This electronic message is only for the exclusive use of the intended recipient. Any review, copying, re-transmission, dissemination, use or 
disclosure by anybody other than the intended recipient is unlawful and strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient or the employee or agent 
responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, please notify us immediately by return mail or telephone and delete/destroy all copies of the original message 
including attachments from your system. This email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, 
lost, destroyed or contain viruses. You are therefore advised to carry out your own virus checks before opening the e-mail or attachments. Our Company 
accepts no liability for errors or omissions in the contents of this message or damage caused by viruses as a result of this e-mail transmission. 
********************************************************************************************************************************
**********************************************  



Date: 28-6-2022
PO No: BLR/PO/22-23/000011 

PO AMT : 3,41,020

Product Description:  Ditting Grinder Unit / Project Name: ,  BLR T2 CBTL 23 Sqmt Bangalore T2

Justification:

Prepared By Approved By

SINGLE VENDOR DECLARATION

Vendor Name: Kaapi Machines India P ltd 

Only known supplier.  (List of the suppliers which were 

contacted below and the specific reasons why each was not a 

viable source).

`

Supplier proprietary item.  (The selected supplier is the only 

manufacturer of this item.  List the reasons why no substitute item 

can be used and if no similar item is available).  

Franchise / Management / User Dept Directed.  (Provide a copy 

of letter, or memo or e-mail specifically directing this source).  

Kaapi Machns is the Only authorised supplier for Ditting 

Grinders approved by by CBTL 

Item / Rate Contracted. (Provide copy of the contract / 

agreement)                                                                                                  


