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Invoices TFS

From: Asha Nair
Sent: 08 August 2024 13:04
To: Invoices TFS; Asha Nair
Subject: Re: fuel bills : JULY-24

Approved 
 
THANKS & REGARDS 
  
ASHA NAIR 
  
K Hospitality Corp 
      
www.k-hospitality.com 
 

From: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> 
Sent: Thursday, August 8, 2024 1:03 PM 
To: Asha Nair <asha.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Asha Nair <asha.nair@copperchimney.in> 
Subject: fuel bills : JULY-24  
  
HI Mam, 
  
     Please  share your Approval on attached fuel bills. 
  
Vehicle No     Bill Number   Amount 
EB2345             1026                24030 
DR2345             1025               12638 


