Amit Upadhyay

From: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Sent: 23 October 2024 11:10

To: Amit Upadhyay; Anuj Dubey

Cc: '‘Manjunath’; surindrabhandari@fcmlindia.com; ‘Lohitha’; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp; Mrunal
Joshi; Parag Pandey; R K

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp ::RFQRound:3 RFQ NO : ROB06RFQ Name:Sanitary
Fitting for Bangalore 080 Domestic Lounge Phase II; Changes in RFQ Closing Date and
time

Attachments: 24P0225.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Amit/ Anuj,

Find as discussed find attached PI against APR no-BLR/P0O/24-25/000217/APR — 1 for your records please release the
balance 17.00 Lacs of advance amount payable urgently

Regards

Binu Balachandran
+91-8452876061

From: R K <bangalorestore2 @fcmlindia.com>

Sent: 23 October 2024 10:59

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: 'Manjunath' <bangaloreadmin@fcmlindia.com>; surindrabhandari@fcmlindia.com; 'Lohitha’
<bangaloreoffice@fcmlindia.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-
corp.in>; 'Parag Pandey' <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp ::RFQRound:3 RFQ NO : RO8B06RFQ Name:Sanitary Fitting for Bangalore 080
Domestic Lounge Phase Il; Changes in RFQ Closing Date and time

Importance: High

Dear Mr. Binu,
With reference our discussion here with please find the attached Pl for the balance payment.

Kindly do let me know for any query.

Many Thanks,

Rohith

FCML Luxurious Bathrooms

Tel: 080-41169343, 9739811511

bangalorestore2 @fcmlindia.com | www.femlindia.com

Disclaimer: This message (including any attachment hereto) and any material forwarded herewith are confidential and may also be privileged. It is
intended solely for the addressee. This communication is for the exclusive use of the addressee and the intended recipient(s) and shall not be

1



forwarded to any third party without first obtaining written authorisation from FCML Distributors Private Limited. If you are not the intended recipient
you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. It may contain information which is confidential and legally privileged and the same shall not be used or dealt with by any third
party in any manner whatsoever without the prior written specific consent of FCML Distributors Private Limited. The views expressed in this e-mail are
not necessarily those of the partners or management. If you have received this message in error you are requested to delete it along with all
attachments and copies, if any, from your system and to contact the sender by replying to this message immediately. FCML Distributors Private Limited
is not liable for the improper transmission of this message nor for any damage sustained as a result of this message. We do not guarantee that this
material is free from viruses or any other defects.

From: Binu Balachandran [mailto:binu.balachandran@k-corp.in]

Sent: 28 September 2024 19:01

To: RK

Cc: 'Manjunath’; surindrabhandari@fcmlindia.com; 'Lohitha’; Lovejot Sekhon; Mrunal Joshi; Parag Pandey

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp ::RFQRound:3 RFQ NO : RO806RFQ Name:Sanitary Fitting for Bangalore
080 Domestic Lounge Phase II; Changes in RFQ Closing Date and time

Dear RK ,
Kindly proceed this was a typo error at our end , payment shall be against tax invoice and before dispatches as agreed.
Regards

Binu Balachandran
+91-8452876061

From: R K <bangalorestore2 @fcmlindia.com>

Sent: 28 September 2024 17:43

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: 'Manjunath' <bangaloreadmin@fcmlindia.com>; surindrabhandari@fcmlindia.com; 'Lohitha'
<bangaloreoffice@fcmlindia.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>
Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp ::RFQRound:3 RFQ NO : RO806RFQ Name:Sanitary Fitting for Bangalore 080
Domestic Lounge Phase IlI; Changes in RFQ Closing Date and time

Importance: High

Dear Sir,

Thanks for receiving your valuable purchase order, we would like to state that, in the PO payment terms is 70% advance
& balance 30% after completion of supply and inspection, now we request you to kindly make the amendment OR
written mail to us stating that balance 30% payment before delivery of material against proforma invoice.

If any clarification please feel to call

Many Thanks,

Rohith

FCML Luxurious Bathrooms

Tel: 080-41169343, 9739811511

bangalorestore2 @fcmlindia.com | www.fcmlindia.com




Disclaimer: This message (including any attachment hereto) and any material forwarded herewith are confidential and may also be privileged. It is
intended solely for the addressee. This communication is for the exclusive use of the addressee and the intended recipient(s) and shall not be
forwarded to any third party without first obtaining written authorisation from FCML Distributors Private Limited. If you are not the intended recipient
you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. It may contain information which is confidential and legally privileged and the same shall not be used or dealt with by any third
party in any manner whatsoever without the prior written specific consent of FCML Distributors Private Limited. The views expressed in this e-mail are
not necessarily those of the partners or management. If you have received this message in error you are requested to delete it along with all
attachments and copies, if any, from your system and to contact the sender by replying to this message immediately. FCML Distributors Private Limited
is not liable for the improper transmission of this message nor for any damage sustained as a result of this message. We do not guarantee that this
material is free from viruses or any other defects.

Regards,
Manjunath
9620585600

From: procuresens@safalsoftcom.com <procuresens@safalsoftcom.com>

Sent: 17 April 2024 19:14

To: surindrabhandari@fcmlindia.com

Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp ::RFQRound:3 RFQ NO : RO806RFQ Name:Sanitary Fitting for Bangalore 080
Domestic Lounge Phase IlI; Changes in RFQ Closing Date and time

Date: 17/04/2024 19:13:53
To:LAVANIKAS ENTERPRISES

Kind Attention:

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please note that there is revision in Bid Closing Date and Time. Below are the details :

RFQ Number: RO806

RFQ Name: Sanitary Fitting for Bangalore 080 Domestic Lounge Phase Il
RFQ Round: 3

Old Bid Closing Date and Time: 17/04/2024 23:13:00

Revised Bid Closing Date and: 19/04/2024 23:13:00

Buyer Name : Jogeswar Sahu

URL : https://kcorp.procuresens.com/

Best Regards,
Jogeswar Sahu

jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com

9082949517



HOSPITALITY

K Hospitality Corp

1 Rashid Mansion, Worli Point, Mumbai - 400018, India

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply back to this email ID. You are advised to login to
eProcurement system for more details. We recommend making your Password confidential as
confidentiality is completely Users’s responsibility.



